P wnN PR

| CITY OF

1 Eldridge

Aometown Pethe A Vision

CITY COUNCIL MEETING AGENDA
Monday, November 4", 2024, 7:00 PM
Eldridge Community Center - 400 S 16" Ave - Eldridge, IA

Call to Order and Roll Call
Pledge of Allegiance
Approval of Agenda
Public Comment

Mayor’s Agenda
A. Consideration to Approve City Council Minutes from October 21, 2024
B. Consideration to Approve Bills Payable

Old Business

A. Consideration of Third and Final Reading of Ordinance 2024-13 Amending Title C, Chapter Two, Section 8.04 of Eldridge City
Code for Residential and Commercial/Industrial Sewer Rental Unit billing

B. Consideration of Second Reading of Ordinance 2024-14 Amending Chapter 8, Title C of the Eldridge City Code by adopting
new building codes

New Business
A. Review of the policies related to the responsibility for and maintenance of detention ponds throughout the City

Board/Staff Activity Reports

A. City Administrator

B. Assistant City Administrator
C. City Clerk

D. Police Chief

Adjournment

Next Regular City Council Meeting: Monday, November 18, at 7:00pm at Eldridge Community Center

Mayor Frank King Councilman Ryan lossi Councilman Brian Dockery
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Daniel Collins



AGENDA

City of Eldridge City Council Meeting Minutes

The City of Eldridge, lowa, City Council metin an open session at Eldridge Community Center at
7:00 pm on October 21, 2024.

Council Members Present: Dan Collins, Brian Dockery, Scott Campbell, Ryan lossi, Adrian
Blackwell (absent)

Presiding: Mayor Frank King

Also Present: Marty O’Boyle, Ivory Butler, Henry Rieck, Ayden Tschopp, Davis Hoeper, Cole Green,
Jackson Stevenson, Ray Nees, Erin Gentz, Dale Grunwald, Tony Cavanaugh, Haily Sanders, & Zach
Howell

Motion by Dockery to approve the agenda. Second by Collins. Motion was approved unanimously
by voice vote.

Public Comment
Students that were present introduced themselves.

Mayor’s Agenda
Motion by lossi to approve City Council Minutes from October 7, 2024. Second by Campbell.
Motion was approved unanimously by voice vote.

Motion by Campbell to approve the Committee of the Whole Meeting from October 7, 2024.
Second by lossi. Motion was approved unanimously by voice vote.

Motion by Campbell to approve the bills payable in the amount of $449,690.18. Second by Collins.
Motion was approved unanimously by voice vote.

Motion by Campbell to approve a Liquor License Renewal for Tasty Cafe. Second by lossi. Motion
was approved unanimously by voice vote.

Old Business

Motion by Dockery to approve the Second Reading of Ordinance 2024-13 Amending Title C, Chapter
Two, Section 8.04 of Eldridge City Code for Residential and Commercial/Industrial Sewer Rental
Unit billing. Second by Collins. Roll call vote indicated, Campbell (Aye) , Collins (Aye), Dockery (Aye),
and lossi (Aye)

Motion by Dockery to approve Change Order #1 to the 2024 Eldridge Street Improvements contract
in the amount of $17,144.40 for a pavement patch on W LeClaire Rd and an additional contingency
amount of $25,252.50 for potential curb and gutter replacement along N 7" and N 8" Street only at
the direction of field engineer and City staff . Second by Dockery. Motion was approved
unanimously by voice vote.



AGENDA

Motion by lossi to approve a proposal from Shive Hattery in the amount of $35,750 for the 4" Ave
Traffic Signal project . Second by Collins. Roll call vote indicated, Campbell (Nay), Collins (Aye),
Dockery (Aye), and lossi (Aye)

New Business

Motion by Campbell to approve an estimate from Flenker Land Architecture Consultants, LLC, in
the amount of $4,850 to perform wetlands delineation of Sheridan Meadows Park pond with
options to include additional areas in the delineation. Second by lossi. Motion was approved
unanimously by voice vote.

Motion by lossi to approve the First Reading of Ordinance 2024-14 Amending Chapter 8, Title C of the
Eldridge City Code by adopting new building codes. Second by Collins. Roll call vote indicated,
Campbell (Aye), Collins (Aye), Dockery (Aye), and lossi (Aye)

Motion by Campbell to approve Resolution 2024-27 Approving the FY24 Street Finance Report.
Second by Dockery. Roll call vote indicated, Campbell (Aye), Collins (Aye), Dockery (Aye), and lossi

(Aye).

Motion by Campbell to approve Resolution 2024-26 Approving Stone Brook 3™ Addition Outlot
Replat. Second by Dockery. Roll call vote indicated, Campbell (Aye), Collins (Aye), Dockery (Aye), and
lossi (Aye).

Motion by Campbell to approve Change Orders #1 and #2 for the Triple B Construction Contract for
lowa DOT Project #TAP-T-2290(616)—8V-82 Townsend Farms Trail in the amounts of -$6,750 and

$5,527.50 respectively. Second by lossi. Motion was approved unanimously by voice vote.

Board/Staff Activity Reports

City Administrator

Updated the Council on the outcome of the TEAP kickoff meeting and the City’s Update Breakfast.
Also updated the Council on the City’s Health Insurance renewal.

Fiber will be installed in all city facilities.

Proposal to have the Joint Utility Board and Council Meeting on November 4™,

Lincoln Road traffic counts were submitted to Bi-State.
Assistant City Administrator
Planning & Zoning reviewed the Solar Ordinance revisions will be forthcoming.

City Clerk
Shared with Council that the auditors were onsite last week and were very complimentary of Staff’s

response and record keeping.
Police Chief
Officer Cavanaugh shared with the Council that Officer Sander’s training is going as planned.

Motion by Dockery to move into Closed Session per lowa Code 21.5(1)j “To discuss the purchase or
sale of particular real estate only where premature disclosure could be reasonably expected to
increase the price the governmental body would have to pay for that property or reduce the price



AGENDA

the governmental body would receive for that property” . Second by Campbell. Roll call vote
indicated, Campbell (Aye), Collins (Aye), Dockery (Aye), and lossi (Aye)

Motion by Dockery to adjourn at 8:27 pm Second by Collins. Motion was approved unanimously by
voice vote.



AGENDA

BILLS PAYABLE
CHECK# |DEPARTMENT FUND VENDOR DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

1040(INS REIMB 820 5-001-6183 |EBS - EMPLOYEE BENEFIT SYSTMS  |PSF - INS CLAIM FUNDING $ 5,775.36

1040(INS COBRA 820 5-820-6151 |EBS - EMPLOYEE BENEFIT SYSTMS  |PSF/COBRA INS CLAIM FUNDING $ 393.40
155073|POLICE 0015-110-6150 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 490.48
155073|POLICE 0015-110-6150 |DELTA DENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 44.00
155073|POLICE 0015-110-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 204.78
155073|INSPECTIONS 0015-170-6150 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 52.06
155073|INSPECTIONS 0015-170-6150 |DELTA DENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 4.00
155073|INSPECTIONS 0015-170-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 26.23
155073 |STREETS 0015-210-6150 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 410.88
155073 |STREETS 0015-210-6150 |DELTA DENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 24.00
155073 |STREETS 0015-210-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 111.55
155073|VEH MAINT 001 5-299-6150 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 26.03
155073|VEH MAINT 001 5-299-6150 |DELTA DENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 2.00
155073|VEH MAINT 0015-299-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 9.85
155073|COMM DEV 001 5-599-6150 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 86.94
155073|COMM DEV 001 5-599-6150 |DELTA DENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 4.00
155073|COMM DEV 001 5-599-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 22.64
155073|ADMIN 0015-611-6150 |DELTADENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 60.86
155073|ADMIN 0015-611-6150 |DELTADENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 2.80
155073|ADMIN 0015-611-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 22.08
155073 [FINANCE 001 5-620-6150 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 55.70
155073|FINANCE 001 5-620-6150 |DELTA DENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 4.00
155073 |FINANCE 001 5-620-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 17.57
155073 |SEWER 610 5-815-6150 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 450.46
155073 |SEWER 610 5-815-6150 |DELTA DENTAL BASIC LIFE INS PREMIUMS $ 17.20
155073 |SEWER 610 5-815-6150 |DELTA DENTAL LTD INSURANCE PREMIUMS $ 90.80
155073|INS COBRA 820 5-820-6151 |DELTA DENTAL DENTAL/VISION INS PREMIUMS $ 119.58
155074(POLICE 0015-110-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 8,336.40
155074 |INSPECTIONS 0015-170-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 478.13
155074 |STREETS 001 5-210-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 5,819.18
155074|VEH MAINT 001 5-299-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 538.33
155074{COMM DEV 001 5-599-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 1,076.65
155074|ADMIN 0015-611-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 753.66
155074 |FINANCE 001 5-620-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 239.07
155074 |SEWER 610 5-815-6150 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 3,792.01
155074|INS COBRA 820 5-820-6151 |WELLMARK BLUE CROSS HEALTH INS PREMIUMS $ 1,266.65
155075|STREETS 001 5-210-6373 |ACCESS SYSTEMS LEASING CITY SHOP PRINTER $ 94.59
155075|FINANCE 001 5-620-6340 |ACCESS SYSTEMS LEASING CITY HALL PRINTER $ 175.88
155076|POLICE 0015-110-6599 [ALWAYS CLEAN LLC JANITORIAL SVCS $ 300.00
155076|STREETS 0015-210-6310 [ALWAYS CLEANLLC JANITORIAL SVCS $ 300.00
155076|ADMIN 0015-611-6310 [ALWAYS CLEANLLC JANITORIAL SVCS $ 300.00
155077|POLICE 0015-110-6181 [AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES SPATARU - TACTICAL PANTS $ 170.00
155077|POLICE 0015-110-6181 [AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES SCHWERTMAN - TACTICAL PANTS $ 90.00
155077|ADMIN 0015-611-6310 [AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES NIETO - FILE ORGANIZER $ 11.82
155077|FINANCE 001 5-620-6506 |[AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES LETTER TRAY $ (9.02)
155077|FINANCE 001 5-620-6506 |[AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES FLASHDRIVES- CLOSED SESSIONS $ 55.00
155077|SEWER 610 5-815-6506 [AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES USB CHARGERS $ 37.98
155078 ROAD USE 110 5-210-6727 |ANDY SCHWARZ LLC 2020 DUMP TRUCK $ 140,000.00
155079|SALES TAX 121 5-750-64071 |BENDER JEFF SQR REIMBURSEMENT $ 1,000.00
155080(FINANCE 001 5-620-6401 [BOHNSACK & FROMMELT LLP YEAR END AUDIT 6/30/24 $ 14,437.50
155082|POLICE 0015-110-6506 |COMMERCIAL PRINTERS GOLF CART STICKERS $ 22.50
155082|FINANCE 001 5-620-6506 |COMMERCIAL PRINTERS GOSLOWSKY - BUSINESS CARDS $ 55.00
155084 [SALES TAX 121 5-750-64071 |HARMS RYAN SQR REIMBURSEMENT $ 960.00
155085|POLICE 001 5-110-6470 |HUMANE SOCIETY OF BOARDING FEES $ 150.00
155087|SALES TAX 121 5-750-64071 |LAZIO SAM SQR REIMBURSEMENT $ 1,000.00
155088|ROAD USE 110 5-210-6530 |MANATTS INC POTHOLE PATCHING $ 288.00
155089|SEWER 610 5-815-6310 |MENARDS WINTER HEAT CABLE $ 51.96
155090|POLICE 001 5-110-6727 |MERSCHMAN HARDWARE PD - SPEED TRAILER $ 31.98




AGENDA

155090|STREETS 0015-210-6310 |MERSCHMAN HARDWARE LIGHTER FOR GRILL $ 9.59
155090|STREETS 0015-210-6310 |MERSCHMAN HARDWARE PROPANE FOR FORKLIFT $ 29.99
155090|STREETS 0015-210-6310 |MERSCHMAN HARDWARE LP TANKS FOR GRILL $ 39.98
155090|STREETS 0015-210-6310 |MERSCHMAN HARDWARE BATTERIES $ 35.98
155090|STREETS 0015-210-6512 |MERSCHMAN HARDWARE CHAIN SAW FILE $ 6.59
155091 |STREETS 0015-210-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 105 E LECLAIRE SIGN SHOP $ 35.27
155091 |STREETS 0015-210-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 105 E LECLAIRE $ 14.54
155091 |STREETS 0015-210-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 105 E LECLAIRE OFFICE $ 37.43
155091|ST LIGHTING 001 5-230-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 305 N 3RD LIGHT $ 541.55
155091|ST LIGHTING 001 5-230-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 2951 S 9TH AVE SIREN $ 10.64
155091|FINANCE 001 5-620-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 313N 3RD $ 17.13
155091|FINANCE 001 5-620-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 301 N 3RD $ 14.54
155091|FINANCE 001 5-620-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 309 N 3RD $ 14.54
155091 |SEWER 610 5-815-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 601 TRAILS RD $ 5,533.73
155091 |SEWER 610 5-815-6371 |MIDAMERICAN ENERGY CO 601 TRAILS RD $ 71.68
155092 |SEWER 610 5-815-6320 |NEWARK CORPORATION BACKUP FLOAT $ 64.39
155093|SALES TAX 121 5-750-64071 |MARTIN O'BOYLE SQR REIMBURSEMENT $ 465.00
155094 |SALES TAX 121 5-750-64071 |ODEGAARD MARC SQR REIMBURSEMENT $ 740.00
155096|POLICE 0015-110-6319 |PER MAR SECURITY SERVICES PD SERVICE AGREEMENT $ 41.67
155098 |SEWER 610 5-815-6407 [PFM FINANCIAL ADVISORS LLC REVENUE REQUIREMENTS ANALYSIS $ 5,000.00
155099|STREETS 001 5-210-6373 [QUAD CITIES TAS ANSWERING SERVICES $ 31.79
155099|SEWER 610 5-815-6373 |QUAD CITIES TAS ANSWERING SERVICES $ 31.80
155100{STREETS 0015-210-6181 |[QUAD CITY SAFETY INC. SAFETY GLASSES AND GLOVES $ 108.00
155104 STREETS 0015-210-6331 |RIVER VALLEY COOPERATIVE DIESEL $ 1,242.74
155105|POLICE 001 5-110-6506 [RNJS DISTRIBUTION INC. CITY HALL/PD WATER $ 5.75
155105|FINANCE 001 5-620-6506 [RNJS DISTRIBUTION INC. CITY HALL/PD WATER $ 5.75
155109|SEWER 610 5-815-6332 |[SCOTT COUNTY RECORDER RANGER REGISTRATION $ 20.50
155110{POLICE 0015-110-6413 [SCOTT CO SHERIFFS DEPT. BOOKING FEES $ 250.00
155111{ROAD USE 110 5-210-6407 |SHIVE-HATTERY ENGINEERS LECLAIRE RD CORR STUDY $ 3,260.00
155111{ROAD USE 110 5-210-6771 |SHIVE-HATTERY ENGINEERS 2024 PROJECTS $ 14,900.47
155111|SALES TAX 121 5-750-6730 |SHIVE-HATTERY ENGINEERS TOWNSEND FARMS 12TH & 13TH $ 11,207.32
155112(POLICE 0015-110-6506 |[SHRED-IT SHRED FOR PD $ 123.63
155113|SEWER 610 5-815-6320 [VEGA HOME OF VALUES E6 BASIN LEVEL SENSOR $ 1,146.96
155114|INSPECTIONS 0015-170-6373 [VERIZON WIRELESS CITY CELLULAR $ 41.47
155114|STREETS 001 5-210-6373 [VERIZON WIRELESS CITY CELLULAR $ 278.10
155114|FINANCE 001 5-620-6373  [VERIZON WIRELESS CITY CELLULAR $ 41.47
155114|SEWER 610 5-815-6373 [VERIZON WIRELESS CITY CELLULAR $ 144.43
155115[STREETS 0015-210-6512 |WHITE CAP LP CONCRETETOOLS $ 114.47
ACH|SPLIT SPLIT PAYROLL 10/26/2024 PAYROLL 10/26/2024 $ 103,710.10
TOTAL:| $ 339,741.51




AGENDA

CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

AHormetown Piche A& Vesiore
ORDINANCE 2024-13

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL/INDUSTRIAL SEWER RENTAL UNITS

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING TITLE C, CHAPTER TWO, SECTION 8.04 OF THE
ELDRIDGE CITY CODE, REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT WITH THIS
ORDINANCE AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Section 1.00. Section 8.04, Chapter Two, Title C of the Eldridge City Code is amended by
removing the following language.

§ 8.04. Residential sewer rentals shall be charged to the owner;
commercial/industrial sewer rentals may be charged to the owner or tenant.

Section 2.00. All ordinances, or parts of ordinances, in conflict with this ordinance are
hereby repealed.

Section 4.00. This ordinance shall take effect upon passage and publication according to law.
Passed and approved this 4™ day of November 2024.

Attest:

Mayor, Frank King Martha Nieto, City Clerk

Blackwell OYea / ONay / O

Campbell OYea / ONay / O

Collins OYea / ONay / O

Dockery OYea / ONay / O

Tossi OYea / ONay / O

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi

Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery



City of Eldridge

CITY OF
MEMORANDIUM "arEldridge
To: Mayor and City Council
From: Jeff Martens, Assistant City Administrator
Re: Sewer Billing Account Ordinance
Date: 10/7/2024

Mayor and City Council,

Title C, Chapter 2, Section 8.04 of the City Code currently contains confusing language requiring the
sewer bills of residential rental units to be charged to the owner of the property.

This necessitates the creation of a third billing account for every residential, commercial and
industrial rental unit resulting in a confusing system that is complicated to manage. Property owners
have complained about this policy and questioned its relevance.

After consulting with the billing clerks on this issue the staff is requesting that this portion of the City
Code be removed. The Sewer Superintendent is unaware of any reason why this request could not be
granted.

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Brian Dockery
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Ryan lossi



AGENDA

CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

AHormetown Piche A& Vesiore
ORDINANCE 2024-14

BUILDING CODES

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER EIGHT, TITLE C OF THE ELDRIDGE
CITY CODE BY ADOPTING NEW BUILDING CODES, REPEALING ALL
ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT WITH THIS ORDINANCE AND PROVIDING FOR
AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Codes Adopted:

A. Adoption:
Pursuant to published notice and public hearing, as required by law:

International Building Code 2021

International Residential Code 2021

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2021

International Fire Code 2021
And their related codes as referenced, are hereby adopted in full except
for such portions as may hereinafter be deleted, modified, or amended,
and all subsequent supplements to the above-mentioned international
codes as published.

B. An official copy of:

International Building Code 2021

International Residential Code 2021

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2021

International Fire Code 2021
An official copy of all referenced books is on file in the Building
Safety Department Office, Eldridge City Hall for public inspections,
and copies thereof are for sale at the cost to the public through the
International Code Council online.

C. More Restrictive Requirements Apply:
If any conflict exists between the adopted International Codes, Uniform
Codes, National Codes, and other City ordinances, the more restrictive code
requirement applies.

Section One 1.00 TITLE AND ADOPTION: Delete text and replace with:
1.0 Title and Adoption

(A) The City Council does ordain as follows: that specific technical codes listed for
adoption in this ordinance, two copies of each, which are on file in the office of the City
Clerk, being marked and designated collectively as: “the City of Eldridge Building
Code”, for the city, be and are hereby adopted in full, excluding their appendices (except
as may herein be amended, modified, revised, changed or deleted) and further being

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery



AGENDA

CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

placed in Title C: Public Works, Chapter Eight: Adoption of Specific Codes. This
adoption repeals and supersedes all previous codes and ordinances or parts of codes and
ordinances in conflict herewith and provides for an effective date. If any conflict exists
between requirements in the specific technical codes, state codes or municipal codes
adopted, the municipal code requirement shall apply.

(B) The City Clerk shall certify the adoption of these specific technical codes and this
chapter and shall cause the same to be published as required by law. These specific
technical codes and this chapter shall take effect and be in force, from and after its
approval and publishing as required by law, with an enforcement date of January 1%,
2025.

(C) All buildings shall be required to comply with the code in force at the time
the building permit was issued, and the City retains the right to prosecute owners
of buildings for Code violations under those codes, even if the codes are amended
or replaced by newer versions.

(D) Remodeling or reconstruction of buildings shall comply with the codes as
prescribed therein.

Section Two The following language for the listed specific sections of Chapter Eight of the
Eldridge City Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

4.00 Specific Technical Codes Adopted

4.01 Delete and replace with: “4.01 The following codes are hereby adopted in full except for
such portions as may be deleted, modified or amended and all subsequent supplements to the
below mentioned international codes as published.

(A) 2021 International Building Code

(B) 2021 International Residential Code

(C) 2015 International Property Maintenance Code

(D) Uniform Plumbing Code, as adopted by the State of lowa

(E) 2020 National Electric Code

(F) International Mechanical Code, as adopted by the State of Towa
(G) 2015 International Energy Conservation Code

(H) 2015 International Existing Building Code

(I) 2021 Swimming Pool and Spa Code

(J) 2021 International Fire Code”

4.05  Delete text and replace with: “4.05 This code adoption shall take effect on January 1*,
2025. The city retains the right to prosecute code violations under previous codes.
Remodeling or reconstruction of buildings shall comply with the codes as prescribed
therein.”

5.00 Delete and replace with: “5.00 Amendments to the 2021 International Building
Code.”

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery


https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/eldridgeia/latest/eldridge_ia/0-0-0-2992#JD_TC
https://codelibrary.amlegal.com/codes/eldridgeia/latest/eldridge_ia/0-0-0-10610#JD_TCCh8

CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

5.01  Delete in its entirety and replace with: “The International Building Code, 2021 edition,
published by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club
Hills, IL 60478, is hereby adopted as the requirements for the design, construction,
alteration, relocation, demolition, installation, use and occupancy of every building
structure or appurtenances attached to such structures with the following amendments.”

(A) 101.1 Title. Insert “the City of Eldridge, lowa” as NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(B) 101.4.2 Mechanical. Replace “International Mechanical Code” with “lowa Mechanical
Code.

(C) 101.4.3 Plumbing. Replace “International Plumbing Code” with “lowa Plumbing
Code”.

(D) 103.1 Creation of Enforcement Agency. Insert “Building Safety Department” in place
of “insert name of department”.

(E) 105.2 Building. Delete (2) Fences, in its entirety.

(F) 105.2 Building Delete (6) Sidewalks and driveways, in its entirety and replace with the
following: (6) Concrete flatwork on private property.

(G) 105.3.2 Time limitation of Application. Change ‘180 days” and “90 days” to “30 days”.

(H) 105.5 Expiration. Delete and replace with “105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued under
the provisions of this Code shall expire twelve (12) months from the date of issue.
Exception: a permit application that is accompanied by construction schedule of a longer
specific duration may be issued for the term of the construction schedule with approval
of the Building Official. If the work has not been completed by the expiration date of the
permit, no further work shall be done until the permit has been renewed by the owner or
owners agent and by payment of the renewal fee as established by Resolution of the City
Council, and provided no changes have been made in plans or location.

(D Chapter 11 Accessibility. Add “Where the provisions of this code conflict with the lowa
State Building Code, Division VII, Accessibility Rules and Regulations for the
Physically Handicapped Section 661-16.700 (103A), the latter shall apply.

(J) Chapter 29 Plumbing Systems. Delete all references to the “International Plumbing
Code” and replace with “lowa State Plumbing Code”.

(K) 3303 Demolition. Add “3303.8 Site clearing. The demolition site shall be cleared of all
debris associated with the structures being removed. All mechanical groundwork shall be
removed from the site of demolition. Foundation walls may be used as solid fill provided
a site plan providing notice of the location and depth of the foundation is recorded on the
parcel with the Scott County Recorder, and a recorded copy is filed with the Eldridge
Building Safety Department. In all cases, concrete shall be removed or collapsed so as to
allow burial 24” below final grade. Basement and on grade concrete slabs shall be
removed or substantially pulverized to allow adequate drainage. Demolition work shall

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery

AGENDA



AGENDA

CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

include site work as necessary to fill all excavations and to create a smooth and even
finish grade capable of supporting vegetation.

Materials and specifications for filling and final site work are as follows: Only material
that will not decompose in the ground shall be used for filling all excavations to within
24” of the top of the surrounding grade. The top 24” of fill material shall be tillable soil,
of which the formed aggregate does not exceed 1-1/2 inches. An earthen crown shall be
provided at the center of the demolition site to allow for proper site drainage. Final site
work shall include stabilization with a vegetative cover of at least 70% over the entire
site.”

6.00  Delete and replace with: “6.00 Amendments to the 2021 International Residential
Code”

6.01  Delete text and replace with: The International Residential Code, 2021 edition, published
by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL
60478, is hereby adopted as the requirements for the design, construction, alteration,
relocation, demolition, installation, use and occupancy of one- and two-family dwellings
and townhouses and attached or unattached accessory structures with the following
amendments.

(A) All references to building line and zoning are void, and the subject matter of the zoning
ordinance (Title D, Chapter 2 of the City Code) shall be applicable.

(B) R101.1 Title. Insert “City of Eldridge, lowa” as NAME OF JURISDICTION].

(C) R101.2 Scope. Add “demolition projects will meet the requirements of Section 3303
Demolition of the 2021 International Building Code as amended.

(D) R105.2 Building. Delete (1) in its entirety and replace with the following: “(1) One-story
detached accessory structures used as tool and garden sheds, playhouses and similar uses
provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet.”

(E) R105.2 Building. Delete (2) Fences, in its entirety.

(F) R105.2 Building. Delete (5) in its entirety and replace with “(5) Concrete flatwork on
private property.”

(G) 105.3.2 Time limitation of Application. Change ‘180 days” and “90 days” to “30 days”.

(H) R105.5 Expiration. Delete and replace with “105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued
under the provisions of this Code shall expire ( 12) months from the date of issue.
Exception: a permit application that is accompanied by construction schedule of a longer
specific duration may be issued for the term of the construction schedule with approval of
the Building Official. If the work has not been completed by the expiration date of the
permit, no further work shall be done until the permit has been renewed by the owner or
owner’s agent and by payment of the renewal fee as established by Resolution of the City
Council and provided no changes have been made in plans or location.

(D Table R301.2 (1) Climate and geographical design criteria.

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery



CITY OF

AGENDA

Yay Eldridge
Wind Design Subject to Damage From
. Seismic
Ground . Wind-
Topo Special Design
Snow Load | Speed graphic Wind l]))(::l‘::“i’s Category E;(;St
k : i
(mph) Effects Region Zone™ Weathering * depth® | Termite ¢
ps =30 psf,
alcs for
drift loads Moderate to
shallusea | 115 NO NO NO A SEVERE 427
Heavy

ground
snow load
pe=25 psf
Winter Ice Barrier Mean
Design Underlayment Air Freezing | Annual
Temp ¢ | Required " Flood Hazards ¢ Index ! Temp

a. Initial NFIP 03/01/1991

b. Community #190574
-4°F YES 2000 50.5°F

c. Panel date 3/23/2023 on panels 19163C0200G,

0215G, 0220G and 4/11/2024 on panels
0335H, 0355H and 0360H.

(J) R302.13 Fire Protection of floors. Delete in its entirety.

(K) R311.3.2 Floor elevations at other exterior doors. Exception. Change “two” to
“three”.

(L) R311.7.8.2 Continuity. Add “Exception 3. Handrails within an individual dwelling unit
or serving an individual dwelling unit that has one (1) offset or interruption per flight of
stairs six inches (6”) in total length shall be considered, for the purpose of this code, to be
continuous.”

(M) R313.1 Townhouse Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems. Exception, Add: “or have 4 or
fewer units in a building.”

(N) R313.2 One and two family dwelling automatic sprinkler systems. Delete in its entirety.

(O) R320 Accessibility. Delete and replace with “R320 Accessibility. [owa Administrative
Code 661, Chapter 302 shall apply.”

Mayor Frank King
Councilman Adrian Blackwell

Councilman Scott Campbell
Councilman Daniel Collins

Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Brian Dockery




CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

(P) Table R403.1(1) Delete and replace with the following table R403.1 (1)

AGENDA

Table R403.1 Thickness of Minimum Minimum Minimum
Number of Foundation Thickness width of Depth of
Floors Walls (inches) Footing Footing Foundation
Supported (inches) (inches) Below Finish
Grade (inches)
Unit Concrete Masonry
1 8 8 16 42
8 8 16 42
3 10 12 18 42

1. Foundations may support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of floors. Foundations
supporting roofs only shall be as required for supporting one floor. Footings shall be
continuous and contain a minimum of two Y-inch reinforcement bars, and have a minimum
compressive strength of 2,500 pounds per square inch at 28 days.

A one-story wood frame building used as a private garage detached, accessory to a single
family dwelling and not over 720 square feet in floor area may be constructed on a floating
slab-on-grade provided the following conditions are met: A concrete perimeter grade-beam,
twelve inches deep and twelve inches wide and reinforced with two Y4-inch reinforcement
bars shall be installed to support the exterior walls. A minimum four-inch thick concrete
floor slab reinforced with wire mesh or fiber mesh shall be installed within the perimeter
beam and shall be formed to allow a continuous pour consisting of the required grade beam
and floor.

2. Cast-in-place concrete foundation walls shall be concrete having a minimum compressive
strength of 28 days of not less than 3,000 pounds per square inch. In addition, the following
shall apply:

A. The minimum thickness of a wall shall be 7 % inches.

B. Walls shall be reinforced with no less than three half-inch diameter, deformed
ASTM A615 grade 40 steel bars placed horizontally at the center of the wall,
with one bar located near the top, one bar located near the bottom and one bar
located near mid-height of the wall.

(Q) R403.1.1 Minimum Size (Footings), Add “Exception 1. Deck footings not supporting a
roof or overhead structure may be a minimum 12 inches in diameter and 42 inches below
finished grade. Exception 2. All covered decks, screened porches, three season rooms,
four season rooms, room additions and similar structures shall be supported on
foundations compliant with Table R403.1 or conforming to one of the following
methods:

1. Pier footings designed and stamped by a design professional.
2. 12 inch wide reinforced trench footing 42 inches in depth.

3. 16” wide spread footings 42 inches in depth with a minimum 8 inch masonry or
concrete foundation wall as per Figure 403.1.1.

Mayor Frank King
Councilman Adrian Blackwell

Councilman Scott Campbell
Councilman Daniel Collins

Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Brian Dockery



CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

(R) R403.1.4.1 Frost Protection Exception 1, delete “600” and replace with “720”. After
“(3048 mm) or less” add: ““, and where wall lengths do not exceed 30’ long,”

(S) R507.3.1 Delete table in its entirety and replace with "507.3.1 Deck and Addition
Footing Requirements."

"All decks without roof support shall have a minimum footing size of 12" in diameter and
42" in depth."

"All decks and additions (screened porches, 3 seasons rooms, 4 seasons rooms, etc)
with roof and floor loads combined shall have one of the following.

1 Pier footings designed by a professional engineer.
2 12" wide trench footing 42" in depth extended out 12" past point load
3 Spread footings 42" in depth with a minimum 8" masonry wall

or concrete foundation wall.”

(T) Chapter 11. Energy efficiency. Delete in its entirety and replace with “Chapter 11
Energy Efficiency. The 2015 International Energy Conservation Code, Residential
Provisions as amended, shall apply.”

(U) M1601.1.1 Above ground duct systems. Delete “7.3 Stud wall cavities shall not convey
air from more than one floor.”

(V) Chapters 25-32 (Plumbing requirements) Delete in their entirety and replace all
references to these chapters with the lowa State Plumbing Code.

13.00. Delete and replace with “13.00 Amendments to the 2021 International Swimming Pool
and Spa Code.”

13.01. Delete text and replace with: The provisions of the International Swimming Pool and Spa
Code, 2021 edition, published by the International Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road,
Country Club Hills, IL 60478, are hereby adopted by reference as the requirements for the design,
installation, maintenance, alteration, and inspection of aquatic recreational facilities, pools and
spas with the following amendments:

(A) 101.1 Title. Insert “City of Eldridge, lowa” as [NAME OF JURISDICTION]

(B) 101.2 Scope. Add “Exception: Residential, on ground, storable pools supplied by a single
pool manufacturer as a kit that includes a pump and motor that is double insulated with a
factory installed 25° GFCI protected cord shall be installed per the manufacturers
installation instructions and meet the barrier requirements of chapter 3. It shall be the
owner/installers responsibility to ensure ongoing compliance with the installation for
access, barriers and signage.

(C) 103.1 Creation of agency. Insert “Eldridge Building Safety Department” as [Name of
Department]

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery

AGENDA



CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

(D) 105.5.3 Expiration. Delete and replace with “105.5.3 Expiration. Every permit issued
under the provisions of this Code shall expire twelve (12) months from the date of issue.
Exception: a permit application that is accompanied by construction schedule of a longer
specific duration may be issued for the term of the construction schedule with approval of
the Building Official. If the work has not been completed by the expiration date of the
permit, no further work shall be done until the permit has been renewed by the owner or
owner’s agent and by payment of the renewal fee as established by Resolution of the City
Council and provided no changes have been made in plans or location.

(E) 108.6 Refunds. Delete in its entirety and replace with: “The Building Official may
authorize the refunding of not more than 80% of the permit fee paid when no work has
been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. Permit fees will not be
refunded if $50 or less.”

(F) 107.4 Violation Penalties. Insert “Simple Misdemeanor” as [SPECIFY OFFENSE],
insert “$650.00” as [AMOUNT], insert “30” as [NUMBER OF DAYS].

(G) 303 Energy. Delete in its entirety.
(H) 306 Decks. Delete 306.2 through 306.9.1 in their entirety.
(D 307.2.3 Freeze protection. Delete in its entirety.

(J) 701.1 Scope. Add “Exception: Residential, on ground, storable pools supplied by a single
pool manufacturer as a kit that includes a pump and/or filter and/or a motor that is double
insulated with a factory installed 25> GFCI protected cord shall be installed per the
manufacturers installation instructions and meet the barrier requirements of chapter 3. It
shall be the owner/installers responsibility to ensure ongoing compliance with the
installation for access, barriers and signage.”

14.00. Delete and replace with “14.00 Amendments to the 2021 International Fire Code.”

14.01. The provisions of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition, published by the International
Code Council, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478, is hereby adopted
regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards
arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous materials, and from conditions hazardous
to life and property in the occupancy of buildings and premises with the following amendments:

(A) 101.1 Title. Insert “the City of Eldridge, lowa” as NAME OF JURISDICTION]

(B) 101.2.1 Appendices. The following appendices are adopted with this code:
1. Appendix B Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings.
2. Appendix C Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution.
3. Appendix D Fire Apparatus Access Roads.
4. Appendix H Hazardous materials management Plan and Hazardous Materials
inventory Statement Instructions.
5. Appendix I. Fire Protection Systems- Noncompliant Conditions.

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery

AGENDA



CITY OF

Yay Eldridge

(C) 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. Insert “Eldridge Building Safety Department”
as [Name of Department]. All references to the Fire Code Official shall mean the
Building Official.

(D) 105.3.1 Expiration. Delete all EXCEPT the first sentence and replace with “Every
construction permit issued under the provisions of this Code shall expire twelve ( 12)
months from the date of issue. Exception: a permit application that is accompanied by
construction schedule of a longer specific duration may be issued for the term of the
construction schedule with approval of the Building Official. If the work has not been
completed by the expiration date of the permit, no further work shall be done until the
permit has been renewed by the owner or owner’s agent and by payment of the renewal
fee as established by Resolution of the City Council, and provided no changes have been
made in plans or location.

(E) 112.4 Violation Penalties. Insert “Simple Misdemeanor” as [SPECIFY OFFENSE],
insert “$650.00” as [AMOUNT], insert “30” as [NUMBER OF DAYS].

(F) 107.2 Schedule of permit fees. Insert “City of Eldridge Fee schedule” or “Eldridge Fire
Fee schedule” as applicable.

(G) 113.5 Fee Refunds. Delete (2) in its entirety and replace with: (2) The Building Official
may authorize the refunding of not more than 80% of the permit fee paid when no work
has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. Permit fees will not be
refunded if $50 or less.

(H) 503.2.4 Turning radius. Add, “The turning radius for fire apparatus access shall be not
less than twenty five feet (25°) inside and forty five feet (45”) outside.”

(D 507.5.1.1 Hydrant for standpipe systems. Change “100 feet” to “150 feet”.

(J) Appendix D, D101.1 Scope. Add “Specifications in Table D103.4 and Figure D103.1
may be reduced to those found in Eldridge Standard Design with the approval of the Fire
Code official.

(K) Appendix D, 107.1 exception 2. Add “Appendix D, 107.1 exception 2. Add “A City
Council approved preliminary plat showing the proposed additional access shall be
required for an increase of up to 30 additional homes, for a total of 60 homes maximum,

for this approval.”

Section Four. All ordinances, or parts of ordinances, in conflict with this ordinance are hereby
repealed.

Section Five This ordinance shall take effect on January 1%, 2025.

Passed and approved this 18" day of November, 2024.

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery

AGENDA



r AGENDA
' CITY OF

Va1 Eldridge
Attest:

Mayor, Frank King Martha Nieto, City Clerk

Blackwell OYea / ONay / O

Campbell OYea / ONay / O

Collins OYea / ONay / O

Dockery OYea / ONay / O

lossi OYea / ONay / O

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Ryan lossi

Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Brian Dockery



City of Eldridge

CITY OF
MEMORANDIUM YaiEldridge
To: Mayor and City Council

From: Jeff Martens, Assistant City Administrator

Re: Townsend Farms Developers LC

Date: 11/04/24

A meeting took place on Monday, October 28 between residents of Townsend Farm 1%t Addition and
Ryan Fick of Mel Foster Co representing Townsend Farms Developers LC. The purpose of the meeting
was to turn the detention pond located at S. 5t Street and Pinehurst Drive over to a Homeowners
Association as noted on the plat and following the approved plan that is required by City Code. The
residents of Townsend Farm 1t Addition that were in attendance, led by resident and attorney Ben
Bekel, refused to set up a Homeowners Association at this meeting.

Attached is an email from Ryan Fick with his notes from this meeting, a sign in sheet and an HOA
responsibility sheet he supplied.

The following is additional information on this issue from documents on file:

When Townsend Farm 1t Addition was originally plated on December 1, 1998 a note on the plat
stated that Outlot A, which is the detention pond located on the corner of S. 5t Street and Pinehurst
Drive, shall be maintained by a Homeowners Association. This parcel was never turned over to the
Homeowners Association. Please see attached final plat and covenants for the Homeowners
Association detailing maintenance of this detention pond that were signed by Robert Fick on
November 2, 1998.

At the time of development Outlot A was, and still is, owned by Townsend Farms Developers LC. This
LC was started on September 29, 1998 and lists Robert Fick as the registered agent with a mailing
address of the Mel Foster Co in Davenport. See attached articles of incorporation. This LC filed their
last Biennial Report in 2019 which still listed Robert Fick as the registered agent with the same
mailing address, also attached. On September 7, 2021 a Declaration of Dissolution was issued by
Secretary of State Paul Pate for failure to deliver the 2021 Biennial Report as required by lowa Code,
also attached.

Townsend Farms Developers LC owns a total of three parcels in the City according to the Scott County
Assessor’s website. These parcels include the detention pond listed above (93143310LA) along with a
detention pond located on the corner of S. Buttermilk Road and Pinehurst (93153720LA) and a
detention/access lot (93143370LM) located between 1040 S. 5t Street and 1100 S. 5t Street. Below
are screenshots of these properties followed by information and documentation on the additional
two parcels:

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Brian Dockery
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Ryan lossi



City of Eldridge

CITY OF

MEMORANDIUM "aiEldridge

= )

TOWMSEMD FARM DEVELOPERELC
Dheed}

F07 S5THST

Acres0.22

Waluwe: 51,500

S \fiewr Parcel Repart | Ap Sail Repart | Google Maps

TOWMSEND FARM DEVELOPERS L C
(Deed)

Acres:0.57

Value: 25,400

Wiew: Parcel Report | A Soil Report | Goozle Maps:

93143370LM

TOWMNEEMD FARM DEVELZFERELC
[Deed}

Acres: 019

Value: 51,500

Wiew: Parcel Report | Ag Soil Report | Googhe Maps

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Brian Dockery
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Ryan lossi



AGENDA

City of Eldridge Re...
MEMORANDIUM "arEldridge

T

The detention pond located at S. Buttermilk Road and Pinehurst is labeled on the Final Plat for
Townsend Farms 11t Addition as Outlot A. This plat is dated April 1, 2016. A note on the plat states,
“Outlot A is intended for storm water detention and the entire outlot is designated as a blanket
easement for inspection purposes by the City.” As of this time | have found no other plan on file for
this detention pond but City Code states, “The developer shall be responsible for providing a plan of
ownership of the detention facilities involving a single owner, an association, or another plan of
ownership approved by the city.” The Final Plat is attached for your reference.

The detention/access lot located between 1040 S. 5t Street and 1100 S. 5™ Street is labeled on the
Final Plat for Townsend Farms 7t Addition as Outlot M. This plat is dated May 22, 2006. A note on
that plat states, “Outlot M is designated as a sewer, drainage and utility easement and as an access
easement for the regional detention basin located west of this addition.” Ownership of this parcel is
still Townsend Farms Developers LC. This seems to be an oversite on the part of the City and the
developer as later documents would seem to indicate the parcel should have been transferred to the
City along with the regional detention basin. The Final Plat is attached for your reference.

Now we will look at documentation pertaining to the Regional Detention Basin mentioned above on
the Townsend Farm 7t Addition Final Plat.

Below is a screenshot of the Regional Detention Basin. According to County records this parcel was
transferred to the City from Townsend Farm Developers LC on March 3, 2011. The City has been
maintaining this parcel since at least that time. This parcel is almost entirely Zone A floodplain.

CITY OF ELDRIDGE [Deed)
Acres: 200
Value: 72,500

Wiew: Parcel Regort | Ag Soil Regort | Google Maps

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Brian Dockery
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Ryan lossi



City of Eldridge

CITY OF

MEMORANDIUM "1 Eldridge

fAdosr

Eldridge Resolution 04-31 dated October 11, 2004 establishes the creation of the Regional Detention
Basin but refers to it as the storm water detention pond in the Townsend Farm Additions and
provides that it be accepted as a public improvement. It further resolved that a storm water utility be
created to collect fees to finance the costs of maintenance and improvements for the storm water
detention pond. To my knowledge this was never done. Resolution 04-31 is also attached for your
information.

The covenants of the Townsend Farm 7t" Addition dated May 15, 2006 provide more information on
the creation of the Regional Detention Basin, Outlot M and the involvement of Mel Foster Co and
Townsend Farm Developers LC in the process that led to the City of Eldridge owning this property.

Some recommendations and questions the Zoning Official would like to have reviewed by the City
Council:

1. Would the City be better off pursing ownership of Outlot M in the Townsend Farm 7t
Addition since it our only access to the Regional Detention Basin, or is the access easement
enough even though the parcel is currently owned by an inactive business entity?

2. Review the current Storm Water Ordinance and discuss whether the ordinance lines up with
the current Council’s future vision of who should own and maintain these detention ponds.
Amend City Code to reflect this vision if new. Even if the Ordinance reflects the current vision
of the Council the Responsibilities section needs to be amended to provide clearer
enforcement provisions and assessed cost splits. This discussion would hopefully lead to
answers for the following questions and give staff direction in how to proceed:

a) Isthe current system working?

b) Should a storm water utility be created to collect fees from the users of the regional
detention basin or should Resolution 04-31 be amended or repealed?

c) Should a city-wide storm water fee be considered? This fee could be used for all
aspects of storm water in addition to detention ponds: Intakes, outlets, wetlands,
storm sewer mains, culverts, catch basins, manholes, easements, jetting, televising,
repairs, slip lining/replacement, MS4 requirements, inspections, engineering, etc.

3. Please be aware that there are currently nine other residential detention ponds throughout
the City and any decisions made about the four listed above should affect them all.

Finally, the City’s Stormwater Ordinance is attached for your review.

Mayor Frank King Councilman Scott Campbell Councilman Brian Dockery
Councilman Adrian Blackwell Councilman Daniel Collins Councilman Ryan lossi



AGENDA

From: Ryan J. Fick <rjfick@melfosterco.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2024 2:38 PM

To: Jeff Martens <jmartens@cityofeldridgeia.org>
Cc: Monique Gorsline <monique@vb-law.com>
Subject: Townsend Farm 1st HOA Meeting

Jeff:

| wanted to send an email from the HOA meeting we had on October 28", at 5:15 PM to
thank you for attending as well as to document the response and feedback. Please let me know if
you have any questions or comments or any guidance moving forward. Thank you.

We had 14 of the 28 lot owner(s) there in attendance. See attached the sign in sheet.

| opened the meeting introducing myself and our attorney, Mo Gorsline. When we are at the
stage of transferring outlots to an HOA, as required by the plat of the subdivision and applicable city
codes, | give a brief background and introduction. Then Mo presents on the structure and
responsibilities of the HOA. We will always leave time for the homeowners to ask Mo and me
questions, but we limit those to questions specifically about the HOA formation and
maintenance. We end these HOA meetings with a vote for the HOA officers and directors. Our
company handles all the costs for our attorney’s attendance, the recording of the HOA bylaws, the
deeding of any common properties into the HOA, and any additional initial costs for establishing
the HOA. Once the property is transferred to the HOA, we generally do not have any further
involvement with the HOA because it is designed to be an entity governed and maintained by
homeowners.

At the meeting on October 28, 2024, there were a lot of questions outside the scope of the regular
HOA issues, particularly regarding the detention pond, including why the detention pond was
placed in this subdivision and who receives the benefit from the detention pond. In addition, the
homeowners wanted to know what would happen if they refused to participate in the establishment
and running of the HOA and other questions that we felt were outside the scope of this

meeting. We explained that the detention pond is part of the initial approval of the subdivision and
so having a detention pond was required by the City of Eldridge (“City”) at the time the City
approved the plat for Townsend Farms First Addition. In addition, we discussed the City Code
requirements that require detention ponds in subdivisions. | brought large drawings of the plat to
the meeting and pointed out that the plat requires that the outlot detention area be placed in an
HOA. As we discussed with the homeowners, although the outlot was not originally placed in an
HOA, the adjoining homeowner took care of the outlot for years and so all the
homeowners in the subdivision received the benefit of having the outlot maintained without having
to pay for the maintenance all these years.


mailto:rjfick@melfosterco.com
mailto:jmartens@cityofeldridgeia.org
mailto:monique@vb-law.com

AGENDA

The homeowners were also concerned that they never received notice that an HOA is required for
this subdivision. Monique reminded them that when they purchased the property, the plat showing
the detention area and HOA requirements would have been in their abstract and, therefore, they all
were on notice for the HOA requirement. Ben Bekel, a local attorney, was also in attendance and
was representing Jennifer Bekel, who we believe is his wife. Multiple times during the meeting Ben
attempted to argue about legal issues relating to whether the HOA could be formed and whether
the detention area was necessary. We continued to cite the plat requirement for an HOA to
maintain the detention area as well as the City Code requirements for detention areas. We made
one last attempt to start the presentation of the HOA responsibilities. The homeowners attending
the meeting decided the maintenance of the detention area and the HOA were not their
responsibility and should be the responsibility of the developer or the City. We then concluded the
meeting.

It is our position that we have gone above and beyond what is required by developer to
establish the HOA to maintain the detention area. per the city code and no longer feel the
detention is our responsibility. Please advise if there is anything further you need from us at this
time. Thank you.

Ryan J. Fick, CCIM
| Mel Foster Co. | 3211 E. 35" St. Ct. |
| Davenport, IA 52807 |

| O: (563)823-2274 | C: (563)508-0224 |

The information in this e-mail, including any attachments, is confidential and intended solely for
the addressee(s). Access to this e-mail by anyone other than the intended recipient is
unauthorized. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying or distribution is
prohibited and may be unlawful. Any action taken or not taken in reliance of this e-mail is not
authorized by the sender. If you receive this in error, kindly notify the sender by return e-mail and
delete this e-mail and any attachments.



M

Yo otgy, @) B EHLY | hIV-DIE ~£95 PO LAty IV OSETT a0an Y
o d)\z 6% /\.&S\K&Nﬁ @mwﬁ; WN.\Q )§ J\ﬂ;_/ ._.n\\_ésdﬂ_«. \%QW S\Vﬁig g&&\&&ﬁ
o gq ckuvo..ﬂvfmw A APUA3sowW (5o . 7 L T J.U who.:\}om/ XY MNeJIDW - Nwﬂi\ﬁ
i ,.....c_.wu;».um:w, Y2z- °Lls- £95 *Q 4579294 bog | D veaspyd ¢ VNN

R A | AR TV % | 7 7 Hy

AGENDA

£29/-£15 -0Th

2Q IsavH9) 944

o7 Wb @ erEs WADH]

S¥bb 506 99

v O \&\é ?:m (449

th 7 VS S

) i N
AT DOD .Sh.»x\\@V\\Q\%W\

HeTZ—-057- 28

.;Q L:o&f&.u(unr gic

B Caes!

.@9 LUYDUN B \Ju,.gc.\vm

LIk 0h%-29S

SUASM R vee

VA RYES

1onB@ (V@HZY - o WO HLLN~bhh-C4S Y0 20g (o) | +1¥d |
Ll £329~ 0k — &g Q +w§sﬁf& ¢ 2% 30%/\ ﬁ,
) PSS STERm) | CES-THe-0g Fq B o, [P G V0 Wt
“QHT A\Q&\QZ 374 N w1 \W\QN\M&MN .NQ @N\%ﬁ\i\; ce N szvﬁl W qu
WA IAFoAeD Gfep | bce? WEEIS SPTL] ST L 3 )
SSaIppy lew3 lagwinpN auoyd SSalppy SwieN 1se7 pueisiid

¥20¢/8¢/0T -198ys u| ugis
UOIIRID0SSY S,J8UMO3WOH UONIPPY IST Wi pUdasSuMo]




AGENDA

TOWNSEND FARMS 15T ADDITION Homeowners Association
Formation of the HOA

e File Articles with the Secretary of State—this makes the HOA a
legal entity

e Bylaws-How to run the HOA

e Need to set up a bank account

Information Needed to Establish the HOA

e Registered agent

e Principal office of the HOA

e Date of annual meeting-can set it each year

e Elect board of directors

e Elect officers: possible officers include President, Vice-President,
Secretary and Treasurer.

HOA Responsibilities
The HOA responsibilities-covenants

e Maintain Outlot A-drainage detention area
Additional HOA Responsibilities:

e Obtain liability insurance for Outlot A

e Obtain errors and omissions insurance for the Directors and
Officers

e Establish and maintain a bank account for the assessments

e Decide if third party should manage



SEXPZ-IESELI ON LSVEINING TVRNOLLYN

v£Z86 DA
= 9661 ‘1g Joquiada( saaidxe wmﬁmoﬁ_w Mﬂ
IMOLg a8 Vel e L 8661 ‘22 NIAOLOO #1%a

S 22l 'ON 9susor] "'S ¥ d'd 'I9ASN 1 Plaeg 4 o, a

9'd ‘SHI3ANIONI ONILTINSNOD T VYR R

— "emo] Jo 8jelg _ _
Y3AIN - INIGY3A e R S L '3,00-.21-,00'N 8v3@ Ol Q3NNSSY SVYM £-6.-bl NOILO3S 40 7y ; e
toeitp A sopun 40 ot £q paredad som qusumoop 4318VNO 1SIMHLNOS 3HL 40 3INIT LSIM IHL A3AHNS SIHL HOJ C
ullsAains puel Sy} eyl 4Laeo  £qetey | 7 =
AT VMOI! '39014a@13 40 ALID NOISSINWOD 3INOZ ® NV1d

S3dIM 1H9IT 13341S 404 ANV
d3LvI07 SI 3dNLONYLS 3JHL 3JH¥3IHM 1071 3HL NIHLIM S3dNLONYLS

NOILVIOOSSY SH3INMO3WOH Vv A8 J3NIVLNIVN 38 IVNAIAIONI 01 S3JIAY3S '‘A'L 378VO ANV 3INOHJ313L 014103713
] ] (]
TIVHS ANV NOILN3L130 431VM WHOLS d04 Q3LWN9IS3A SI v 1071LNO SVO d3LVM 4H3IM3S HO0d4 d3LINVYHO SINIWN3SVI ANNOYOHIANN L3MNVIE m
=4
3SN ATNINVd 319NIS 404 J3LVNOIS3A SI LO1 HOV3 SS371 40 JYOW 'S3¥IV .66 SNIVLNOO NOISIAIQBNS C
| m
|
S3S0ddNd L3341S €04 ‘VMOI ‘390180713 40343HL S18Vd TTVWIO30d ANV 1334 NI 34V NMOHS S3ONVLSIA 1V e
40 A1D 3H1 Ol J31VOoKI30 JHVY SAYM 40 EHOIY 13381S 11V _ _ L _ m :
Nid NOMI ¢.8/G (ANNOJ
[ Nid NOMI ¢.8/S ) SNHL NMOHS L3S SINIWNNOW NOYI g rox e z
SNOILVII4ID3dS QHVANVLS 390140713 40 ALID L1S31V'] : 43LYVNO LS3IMHLNOS »
JH1L HL1IM 3ONVAHO0O2V NI d3TIVLSNI 38 OL SLIN3IN3AOHAWI TV [ NIid NOYI ¢.8/G ) * SNHL NMOHS ANNO4 SLIN3ANNOW NOUYI HANdQ9 L3INRLIOS - :
2, :
>
o
»N ﬂ rrna
S3ILON TVHINID he !
alc o
_ “ ¥ i l.u “ Al » v - % .“ ¥ __.. L 9 |Ln
i ] - 4 1 N WL L) - (AN} - uy ] u 2 5 2 3 : 5 O‘V_O D
i e 4 Qo o
| § s
LN3W3SY3 LN3IW3sY3 . £
/  ALMILA B8 H3IM3S : : ; : ALILN B H3IMIS — 67 6% ~
\ OFIrL - "M.SE-.LG-68'N /. : _ "3.00-.21700'N ¥’ £
. ‘W b (e — ) ) > { " ’
| 14N09D QOSy P ew . T lEicoe el T R TR oosi el asEl - | ooes T 00SL _ T\ [c.0vs8—— 0009 b
| "M.G2-.20-.00'S LA 2 [0 .
. SSYHOMVS = _ : 72000 |/ m.ob-kvoseen |
.A\u.\...\\ i - . i it - “. b £ ) : = u ] ~ [ T .
o i 0065 - M.SE-..G-.68'N - u (7] = " > z z = - = z 310 . |o5 - s 50 03] ° Pt L
| H 2P ol =L 0008 b7 0082l -t e BYEZL . s O el e (| _ SR : g L . S : 2 9 Qe oy i SN g B z e
| ke 2 Lol Z — it Follor o s Isle m 5|0 . G|+ 14 08 ceron ) 191 L3 0s garol ) 1S L4 0s s2rol | IR 13 DS G20l ) =191 14 05 s2rOl | Q¢ L4 05 szrol L O [ 14 0S5 08Gll Lofo s Hl- = g .._g_. byl o
Ty S aml olel dls o |F] B e T G5 G5 alo Glo Glo a5 alo o ljra e Baens s
i @ | 14 os cisiEl) - BIE 1S alp BlS | 0s s | Q) By ! L4 0s 529 ) 2IG _.,_O.,u Bl ON o|n —.N oN NN olnN MN o|n .vN o|n mN olN 0 ol NN noo Om—.—.—H Slo | Z|® 14 vs oss 1 | D
0 ] B olR oL &8 3 RIS 9 Ugly T S0l L 2 2k 2n 2Un 2l 2 AR > 4I5S 1P Na | e|on L
Bao . O JA BlE o oF mjon S o]} 10151 25 6l B RIR T - o a2 2 9 a g g e 2E 8 8¢ | oo™
e o e el 8|5 ST e B i 5 2 . i i . o T o | Y Sa =
m M. s aNIT X 2 =z =< ﬁlqw _ et -__/v =« 0% . = o ; ; ) 0 INGT il -
e bt~ % MovE13S ONIgINs ber_.o_ Jﬁ;f ﬂ M 9\%& N M_xoqmﬁm ONIGTING ,ub&ﬁmﬂi m Wm@%& N Moval3s [ oNigNg iy o m .p\‘mvb [ %0v8l13S ONIgUNE nw
‘ o - o . it | : o) < " : : . : rre
Baoaanln e 2 ol e G s Wiy d S@Mp meey o @y ]l sl ) L o e A e e g @ 0008 L _[8 T RER .
5 e 5 OO om e L0l . e . = uﬂl i 5 3 iy ol G e S e ontloy o ot o A e e e o e By, 1260 ot e el e Sl e Y (R i it et lv . S R Gl L ] 4 ko Wi
m o] |5 8¢'92| b8 Isf \ oofi 89yl /| I8 ool N |18 loos) 1 006, ] 00gL s} 00GL ) 006, ] 0L | | /] svolls V| wevol |5 | M.G2-,9G-.68'S |
S 2 .a.bm-_hm-.mm.z\_ / "M.SE-.1G .68'N / T 5 = "M.GE-.LG-.68'N o v of - "M.CE".LG-:68'N i _ s
S . ININISTI ALIILA - e [NW3SYI ALIILA e LNIW3SV3I ALITLLA ; IN3W3SY3 ALNLN—— ININ3SY3 ALITILN
s e 2 X 2 3
ﬁv W gl 3 g 3 gy
ol JAIMG i & LSHNH3NId : fz @
c,_m M e e EEWJ e s o e I e 9
m ¢ : e ol ol O- o O O O O O o ¢ o o = 0 e
® . /.006L |z .00'GL .006L |5 .00GL 00°6L |5 / I 8069 A % ? .oo.om\ .00'GL [ .00'GL ; W ,00°G.L .00°GL 006 .00°GL ,00'GL .00°GL \ 1509 |5 A : 3/@ 8Z'6.L TO
i O e e T o A e el U s .00°09 il Bl e e s s e e e el ol e e e -t ———— gL ——— IR .00°09 ENs e N
o iy O] ] 3 @ @ & s e i i N & @7; s L ¢® AT Ol e -
N s S i o o i M| i i #ove13s ONIaTINg B i S " o - . 3N EBLETER . i —ONI@TIRg e i S S e Tk Mave13s oNngungl O
4 L] 2 T e 2 . = = = rj 0F | - < < - = - *= s & £ Ju_, S 0 i M.. z
B 2.0l o o o o o 2 0]z § - =z U o o o o o o o o o € et g e E . :
] e 2 la _16 o ~lo = e 3 ool = 15 o he o o o o o o £ =lhE & g -
,._,\j o C._T : = % e _n i (N _n : W _o ] ) ) o (A .o e _° 2 m [ a0} M H 0 _ & ; . W _o : ; A W _0 ; i X (N _° W _° g _o g _o g _._ g .0 g .° ik _m.o (@] ”_ l n [an] % N 1
it IO L4 DS ORFQI IO Ld 0S Sell ) o[ 13 b5 Saioll Dol ud DS Serfo TG L] 05 sl ) Rlo [ Ld DS Sesl) R o < #lpg| 1 dd 008 SLLEk )L B el g 08 Serol ) gL s serol M o L4 08 qElon I VD [0 d T0s G201 ) PGl L4 0s saiol I et ik 05 cerol ) Dol L4 0s g2lol 1 ol 14 05 ceior i Ole 114 08 gi'cl ) @ Bl ° a% C( L4 ‘DS Szi'2l _.c.
2 s 3IN o g[® S af® - Bl 8o 3|R gie g[N ol 8N oin a[N 2 Wl e 3|5
ud m 2Iro 21 no 2o N 2l no > S = nior s N lro 2 no n o i o N 3 Ao Lo o g :
8 e P @ Bl 21 o WY, e e QL B 6 5 8. B L = 8 BoG ia g R op R R R SR 1
| | m m m m m 7 o % al | |9 m m m m m m m m mlO71L &M 4 o)
o hd LN3W3ISV3 g beim 5 3, m .ol @ NN @ RS Db % o
¥ LN3W3sV3 > o]l _ b LN3W3sv3 ALITIILN B 4¥3m3S 5, 7 l g LNIWISV 3 -
Ll v ALIILA B ¥IM3S ALILN 8 H3IM3S — 7T e _/! L sl T Gl e i e L s sl e R R T e s e Ui L m 0l et | ALIILN B _H3M3S
B S B L s T L R e Sl SR R it ot IRl s T Bl L T I e i R i A f s r.l_l bkl B Gt el g B s i SR I R SR SR T A I e RSN e S SRR RS e e B S e e e dl s el e L D SR el e TR TR S i o o q |m._.|_..l.|. SRR o
— ] L F — — o s X o —
o o gogz 2 ] i noGl | oogy: & | .00°6L | ,00°GL .T | NS0 @ | o9as \%| .00g6 | 006 ) 00'GL 00°G. ? 00'GL ) ,00'G. ) .00'G. T_ ,00°G. : ,00'GL Ll wog) gg og. el .00'G6 _M, 1 R ey
? | | | W v W \ 9I'6IEl - "3.6€-..G-.68'S e R R W L
e e e s o SN e g e Temm L s ,.,.x!n,ﬂt_,ire;itiii!?!:; iaGees BN T
\ LN3A3 Lan .- _ | A | INIWISY3 ALITLN 5 L NIW3SYI ALIILN ! == ININISV3 ALIILLN
5 _ _ S | | b L L o [ - -
| _ _ | | | o m o & Firee el U s D D e
| | | e ! |
/ Sl A o it _ T i A ‘ o ! c R Vo bt h e s e -4 (o ¢ e -t .
/ I : |
! I i | | 1 _ ! * a g iyt e A V _." PR S
; [ _ ﬁ _ [ [ _ ! [ i I [ [ I _ o el R s
| vanaov . L | | | | | | | | | | | | _
| ‘ - L s Bl MO e g ! o e o Heobl PN e i e o
u_m < Al /f./ - e e R R v 5 : 2 ‘ -h.._ / 4 : = ”...nu : 2 |
/ /,,,,I,Eln.... dfihal e lh L lr— Ll Lt _ e S i e e s B Sl bk ey L _Il ot s G HI A i s i i i b Ik_, el ln_ g o it S i \ - (ll..ll%l\\.lll :
_, : : [ Nid NO¥I ¢.8/6 ONNOA ) EETIE
e ,ﬁ R e R R P e C-6l ¥ NOI1D3S . SRt
= el oo - Uh s B R Al e Bl ey L 4314vNO hmng._.DOmL SN
\ 43INH0D LSIMHLYON .
L e M : . i . o . = oy . L . . i . 5 o il T . . i - . T BT R S
f 1 B - - - . = i L I & i s ﬁ |
M i _‘_\ ﬁ lﬁ h.,. i_\.A. ; F |.. —\ / b a. Faarey : l“» e .u“rz__\d—“ \.“ g ”wq.m ey R e I
! | V _ iy | . i = e 1 R UTE g TR
; | _ | I | ! = i I | I ! EEeee e B el ] I
s s , _ O “ 3 ! (it 1 % iy 11 _ it ! ; : _ i _ : k : ! 1“.\“ HH” : + L _ = F ! | 3 il * .-.m \mn _”. |
ﬂ | ,v | | e | * = o e : : - i - d A e =t e _ sl o e SR _
“ W | ‘ ‘ 1 |+ ww“ \M“a."w U o 5 “ hel ul._“ 4 » 1w - —

o b Tk ] il et L o Gl NOILDO3IS 40 H31YVNO 1SVIHLNOS 3HL 40 1HVd ANV MOI4d 804 NLLV
bl Bl Bl i L RO bt i ol g 7L NOILD3S 40 H3ILHYVNO L1SIMHINOS FHL 40 471VH 1S3M 3FHL 40 1lH¥Vd 9NI3g
|

s
r| @
fi©

o

0081 | MSE LSt N o lgle | g€z | .00-00-.06 30 = . VMOI 'LHOdN3AVAQ
\@f 7 _.%“wx ._@m-@w.,,ﬁ st ’ 14N0O 13341S s_mm 1SV3 112Z¢
VMOl 39diddi3 40 ALID FH1 Ol R S i

Q0«06

- | NOlILIgav 1SHId WHVd aN3ISNMOL s

40 1Vd T1VNId

‘Wd YIS 3JHL 40 1SV3 € IONVH 'HLHON 6L dIHSNMOL HLOTIDANHOS NVA °‘NLLV a




CERTIFICATE OF OWNER

The undersigned, Townsend Farm Developers, L.C., does hereby
certify that we have laid off, platted and gsubdivided said real
estate in accordance with the attached plat. We do.further certify
that this plat is made and submitted with our free consent and
desire.

This subdivision shall be known and designated as Townsend
Farm First Addition to the City of Eldridge, Iowa. All streets and
alleys shown and not heretofore dedicated, are hereby dedicated to
the public.

Front yard building setback lines are hereby established as
shown on this plat, between which lines and the property lines of
the street there shall be erected or maintained no buildings ox
structures.

A perpetual easement is hereby granted to any local public
utility 6; municipal department, their éuccessors and assigns,
within the area shown on the plat and marked as an Easement, to
install, lay, construct, renew, operate, maintain and remove
conduits, cables, pipes, poles and wires with all necessary braces,
guys, anchors, manholes and other equipment for the purpose of
serving the subdivision and other property with the underground
telephone, storm sewer, cable television, electric, gas, sanitary
sewer, water or other service as a part of the respective utility
systems; (Further, an overhead easement is hereby gfanted for those
overhead utilities in existence at the time of this platting); also
is granted, subject to the prior rights of the public therein, the
right to use the streets and lots with the underground service
lines to serve adjacent lots and street lights, the right to cut
down and remove or trim and keep trimmed any trees or shrubs that
interfere or threaten to interfere with any of the said public
utility equipment, and the right is hereby granted to enter upon

the lots at all times for all of the purposes aforegaid. No

AGENDA



permanent buildings or trees shall be placed on said area as shown
on the plat and marked "Easement", but same may be used for
gardens, shrubs, landscaping and other purposes that does not then
or later interfere with the aforesaid uses or the rights herein
granted.

The undersigned proprietors further adopt and make applicable
to Townsend Farm First Addition to the Ccity of Eldridge the
following conditions, restrictions, reservations and covenants
which shall run with the land and shall be binding upon and inure
to the benefit of each lot in said addition and each and every
owner thereof from time to time according to the terms and
conditions hereof.

1. All lots described herein shall be known, described and
used solely as regidential lots, and no residence éhall be erected
on any residential building lot other than one detached single-
family dwelling not to exceed two and one-half stories in height.

2. No residence shall be erected on any residential building
lot nearer than 30 feet to the front lot line, nor nearer than
twenty feet to any rear lot line. The rear line restriction shall
not apply to a garage located on the rear one-quarter of a lot.

3. No trailer, basement, tent, shack, garage, barn or other
outbuilding erected in the tract shall at any time be used as a
residence, temporarily or permanently nor shall any residence of a
temporary character be permitted.

4. No building shall be erected on any lot unless the design
and location is in harmony with existing structures and lbéations
in the tract and does not violate any protective covenants. In any
case, no single-family dwelling shall be permitted on any lot in
this Addition having a ground floor square foot area of less.than
1,200 square feet in the case of a one-story structure, nor less
than a total of 1500 square feet in the case of a one and one-half
or two-story structure. In the case of a split level or split
foyer, the main floor space shall not be legs than 1,200 sqguare
feet. The calculation of said square footage shall be exclusive of

garages and breezeways.

AGENDA



AGENDA

5. ‘Titleholder of each lot, vacant or improved, shall keep
his lot or lots free of weeds and debris.

6. No obnoxious or offensive trade shall be carried on upon
any lot nor shall anything be done thereqn which may be or become
an annoyance or nuisance to the neighborhood.

7. A perpetual easement is reserved over the rear of each
lot as shown on said plat for utility installation and maintenance,
and drainage, where applicable.

8. No parking of trailers, boats, campers or commercial
vehicles shall be allowed outside residences in the subdivision,
except for commercial vehicles in the area on normal business
deliveries, or commercial vehicles involved in the construction of
a house during regular working hours.

9. No antenna shall extend over ten feet beyond the roof
line. No free standing antenna or satellite reception dishes shall
be allowed in said Addition.

10. There shall be formed an Iowa non-profit corporation to
be known as Townsend Farm Homeowners’ Association (hereinafter
referred to as the "Association"), whose purposes, among other
things, shall be to insure and provide for the maintenance of
Outlot A as shown on the Final Plat of Townsend Farm First Addition
to the City of Eldridge, Iowa, all as provided hereinafter: The
Association, through its Béard of Directors, shall establish, levy
and collect from all lot owners in Townsend Farm First Addition an
annual assessment reasonably calculated to pay for the maintenance
and upkeep of the grounds referred to hereinabove and which is
described as Outlot A. Payment of‘the assessment shall be the
personal continuing obligation of the lot ownefs and shall survive
his or her transfer of title and shall be a lien upon the lot when
placed of fecord until paid.

11. These covenants are to run with the land and shall be
binding on all parties claiming under them until twenty years, at
which time said covenants shall be automatically extended for

successive periods of ten years, unless by vote of the majority of



the then owners of the lots, it is agreed to change said covenants
in whole or in part.

12. 1If the parties hereto, or any of them, or their heirs or
assigns shall violate or attempt to violate any of the covenants or
restrictions herein within twenty years from the date hereof, it
cshall be lawful for any other person Or persons owning any other
lote in said Addition to prosecute and bring proceedings at law or
in equity against the person or persons violating or attempting to
violate any such covenant or restriction, to prevent him or them
from so doing or to recover damages Or other dues for such
violation.

13. 1Installation of city sidewalks, should they be required,
shall be paid for by the then owners of said lot or lots at the
time building permits are taken out with the City of Eldridge,
Towa.

14. Invalidation of any one of these covenants by judgment or
Court ordgr shall in no way affect any of the other provisions
which shall remain in full force and effect.

15. The right to enforce these covenants by injunction,
together with the right to cause the removal, by due process of
law, of any structure or part thereof erected or maintained in
violation hereof, is reserved to the several owners of the several
lots in this subdivision and to their heirs and assigns and to the
city of Eldridge if specifically noted as a provision of a
covenant. | |

16. Townsend Farm Developers, L.C., as subdivider of this
Addition, in order that there is harmony‘in design of the exterior
of any residential building or buildings, incidental to such
residential use as may be erected in gaid Addition, the exterior
design of any such building, or buildings, incidental to such
regsidential use shall be approved by Townsend Farm Developers, L.C.
and unless such exterior design be so approved such residential
building or buildings incidental thereto, shall not be erected.
Sloping or pitched roofs are desired, and flat roofs, except for
occasional decks, are to be avoided. Flat-roof, low modern houses,

butterfly or excessive shed roofs, exotic designs of any nature,

AGENDA



extremes in architecture and experiments in design are not deemed
in keeping with the residential community, and consequently might
not be approved. This approval must be in writing.

17. Townsend Farm Developers, L.C. shall also have absolute
and final approval on the erection and construction of any
outbuildings, sheds or appurtenant structures as far as their
location, style, design or size. This approval must be in writing.

Dated this ZUD day of A/OVE%B% , 1998.

TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C.

STER : PERTIES, INC.

(ﬁijaglng Member

Robert C. Fick, President

STATE OF IOWA, SCOTT COUNTY, SS:

IN -

On this gﬁ day of \\C»ﬁ:ﬂ\kwy’, 1998, before me, the
undersigned, a Notary Public in and for said State, personally
appeared ROBERT C. FICK, to me personally known, who being by wme
duly sworn, did say that he is the President of Mel Foster Co.
Properties, Inc. of Iowa, the Managing Member of Townsend Farm
Developers, L.C., and that the instrument was signed on behalf of
said corporation by authority of the Board of Directors; and that
the Board of Directors acknowledges the execution of said
instrument to be the voluntary act and deed of said corporation by

it voluntarily executed. P
N k&»JiﬁkTQD

Notary Publi&

% | _ LORiLEVETZOW
MY COMMISNON EXPIRES
an Joly 16,101

AGENDA



Aeceived: 11 13/98 2:58PM; 1 319 324 1816 -> SECRETARY COF STATE; FPage &

11/13/98 FRI 15:55 FAX 1 319 324 1616 LANE & WATERMAN @006
» AGENDA
<
ARTICLES OF ORGANIZATION :D,;Q;;l T
oF

TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS,L.C. .
=2
TO: THE IOWA SECRETARY OF STATE E%
[
Pursuant to Section 301 of the Iowa Limited Liability Company %

Act, the undersigned hereby adopts the following Articles of
Organization for the limited liability company: ' =
i’
ARTICLE I £
<L
Name 5
[
=
o

The name of the limited liability company is:
TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C.
ARTICLE IT

Initial Registered Agent and Registerad Office

The name of the limited liability company's initial
registered agent and the street address of the limited liability
company's initial registered office are:

Robert C. Fick
c/o Mel Foster Co. Properties, Inc. of Iowa

3211 E. 35th Street Court
Davenport, Iowa 52807

ARTICLE ITI
Principal OGffice

The street address of the limited liability company's
principal office is 3211 E. 35th Street Court, Davenport, Iowa

E2807.
ARTICLE IV

Pericd of Duration

The limited liability company's existence shall commence
upon: the acceptance of these Articles of Organization by the Iowa
Secretary of State under the Jowa Limited Liability Company Act
and shall continue, unless dissoclved sooner in accordance with the
terms of the Operating Agreement or by operatiom of law, for a

pericd of thirty (30) vyears.




Received: 11713798 2:58PM;3 1 319 324 18168 -~> SECRETARY OF STATE: Page 7

11713798 FRI 15:55 FaX 1 319 324 1616 LANE & WATERMAN Booy
) AGENDA
ARTICLE V
Liability

No Member or Manager shall be personally liable for the
acts or debts of the limited liability company except those
gpecifically agreed to in writing by the Member.

ARTICLE VI

Manager

The business affairs of the limited Iiability company shall
be conducted by a Manager as provided in the Operating Agreement.
No Member shall have any authority to bind the limited liability
company except ag authorized by the Manager. The Manager of the
limited liability company shall not be personally liable to the
Company or its Mewbers for any monetary damages, for breach of
fiduciary duties as Manager, except liability: (i) For any breach
©f the Manager's duty of loyalty to the Company or ity Members:
(1i) for acts or omissions not in good faith or which involve
intenticnal misconduct or a knowing violation of law; or (iii} for
a transacticn from which the Manager derives an improper personal
benefit or a wrongful distribution in violation of Iowa code
S490A.807.

ARTICLE VII
Indémnification

1. Each person who is or has been Manager of the Company
(and the agents, employees, successors, and assigns of such
person) who was or ig made party to or is involved in any
threatened, pending, or completed action, suit or proceeding,
whether civil, criminal, administrative, investigative, or
otherwise, by reason of the fact that such person is or has been
Manager of the Company or is or was serving at the request of the
Company as a manager, director, officer, partner, trustee,
employee, or agent of ancther limited liability company,
corporation, partnership, joint venture, trust, emplovee benefit
plan, or other enterprise {the "Indemnitee"), shall be
indemmified and held harmless by the Company to the fullest
extent permitted by applicable law. In additicn to the indemni-
fication conferred in this Article, the indemnitee shall also be
entitled to have paid directly by the Company, the expenses
reasonably incurred in defending any such proceeding asainst the
Indemnitee in advance of its final disposition, to the fullest
extent authorized by applicable law.

2. The Company may, by action of its Manager, provide
indemnification to such officers, employees, and agents of the
Company to such extent and to such effect as the Manager shall
determine to be appropriate and authorize by applicable law.
This is not to be coemstrued to include suppliers and/or sub-
contractors.

Ne408




Received: 11/13/98 2:37PM; 1 319 324 1616 -> SECRETARY OF STATE; Page 8
11/13/98 FRI 15:56 FAXZ 1 319 324 1616 LANE & WATERMAN Boos

AGENDA

3. The rights conferred in this Article shall not be
exclusive of any cother rights under any statute, provision of the
Articles of Organization, or Operating Agreement of the Company,
agreement, vote of the Members of the Company, or otherwise.

4. Any repeal or amendment of this Article by the Company
shall not adversely affect any right to indemnification existing
at the time of such repeal or amendment.

Dated this ng%- day ©of September, 13598, by the Company's
Manageyr, Mel Foster Co. Properties, Inc. of Iowa.

MEL ER)CO. PROPERTIES, INC.
OF O‘&A .
By:

Robhert C. Fick, President

STATE OF IOWA }
} 88:
COUNTY OF SCOTT )

on this X day of September, 1998, before me, the
undersicgned, a Notary Public in and for said County and State,
peraonally appeared Robert C. Fick, President of Mel Foster Co.
Properties, Inc. of Iowa, to me personally known, who, being by
me duly sworn, did say that Mel Foster Co. Properties, Inc. of
Towa is the Manager of Townsend Farm Developers, L.C.; that said
ingtrument was gigned on behalf of said limited liability
company by authority of itz Manager; and that the said Manager
acknowledged the execution of said instrument to be the voluntary
act and deed of said limited liability company, by it and by him

veluntarily executed. P e
e Ty

Notary Public in and &6r said
% S OR LEVETEOW County and State

AL | weommsgr

Lid

FILED
[OWA
SECRETARY OF STATE

J1~13%
o ST

19

S 11




AGENDA

PAUL D. PATE IOWA 2019 BIENNIAL REPORT PAUL D. PATE
for an IOWA Secretary of State
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY
Required by lowa Code
Chapter 489 FILED
Date: 2/25/2019 11:15 AM
Corp No: 222625
Cert No: A19222625

SERVICE - PARTICIPATION - INTEGRITY

1. Name of the limited liability company, its registered agent and office.
TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C.

ROBERT C FICK

C/O MEL FOSTER CO, INC.

3211 E. 35TH STREET COURT

DAVENPORT IA 52807

2. Street address of the principal office of the limited liability company:

Name

Address

3211 E35THSTCT

Address

City State Zip Country

DAVENPORT A 52807 USA

3. Does the limited liability company hold an interest in agricultural land in lowa? Yes
4. Is the limited liability company a "family farm limited liability company"? No

5. Signed: ROBERT C FICK Capacity: MANAGING MEMBER



AGENDA

LucAs BUILDING, FIRST FLOOR
DES MOINES, IOWA 50319

PAUL D. PATE
IOWA SECRETARY OF STATE

No: W01308828
489DLC-222625

TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C.
ROBERT C FICK

C/O MEL FOSTER CO, INC.

3211 E. 35TH STREET COURT
DAVENPORT, IA 52807

Date: September 7, 2021

DECLARATION OF DISSOLUTION

The limited liability company named above is hereby administratively dissolved
pursuant to lowa Code section 489.705 effective September 7, 2021 for failure to
deliver the 2021 Biennial Report as required by lowa Code section 489.209.

YPAULD. PATE SECRETARY OF STATE

TEL (515) 281-5204  FAX (515) 242-5953 WWW.S0Ss.iowa.gov sos@sos.iowa.gov



80251 IDNA

8VEL - 6S€ ( €95 ) ‘HIGANNN 3INOHd
L082S VMOI ‘LHOdN3AVA
13341S Y109 1SVv3 LIlY

O'd ‘SH3I3ANIONI ONILTINSNOD
d3AIN - J3GH3A

A9 Q3¥vd3add

‘Teas sIq} £q PaIaAod s39917s Jo s38ed
AINO LAHHS SIHL
9702 ‘1€ JoqUID3( SI 91ep [BMAUdI 95U3DN AW

9102 ‘10 T4V 1ed

222, JequnN asuadr] g7 ¥ ‘A'd 'I8keN "1 plae(q
raanjeudis

"eMO] Jo 8jejlg 3y} jo

SMR[ 92U} JApun JofaAIng puw] Pasuadr] AMp 8 we [ ey}
pue uoisiazadns [puosaad joearp A{w tepun Jo aw £q
pauLioriad sem Miom LoaIne paje[al ay} pue paredard
SeM JuawInoop JuifsAlns puel SIq} 8y} LJIeo Lqoasy I

‘ALY 3HL A8 S3S0ddNd NOILO3JSNI

d04 IN3IW3ISV3I LIMNVIE V SV Q3LVNOIS3A SI 10711N0 3JAILN3
JHL ANV NOILN3L3d d31VM WHOLS d04 AQ3IAN3LNI SI VvV 1071LNO

‘'Ald3dodd

dHL 40 440 SNNY LN3WIGIS ON LVHL 3JJNSNI OL 3I8ISNOLS3d
38 107 HOV3 40 Y3INMO 3JHL 1VHL S3dIND3Y ALID 3HL

‘L0771 HOV3 NI Q3dIAOdd NOILIINNOD

3JHL HLIM 30NVAH0JIV NI d3T1IVLSNI

alvda

MHITD ALID ‘'NOSN3E "W 3SIN3IA

1S31l1v

HOAVIN '37A08.0 'd NILHVIA

alvd

NVINHIVHO ‘HINVENVNOQ 'V T4V

A8

Ag

VMOI ‘39ai4a13 40 AlID

"SNOILVII4I03dS JUVANVLS 390140113 40 ALID 1S3LVT

39 Ol SLN3IW3AOJdNI

1V

NOISSINNOD 3INOZ ® NV1d

dANd dANS 3JHL OL 39dVHISIA LSNIW S3ANIT dANd dANS TTVNAIAIONI '3.00-.21"c00°'N 4V38 Ol A3NNSSV SVM €-6.-Gl NOILI3S l\. T
40 d314vND LSV3IHLINOS 3IHL 40 3NIT LSV3 3JHL A3AYNS SIHL 404
‘NOILVA3T3 ANNOYY M3N 3HL Ol 401 3JTOHNVW 3HL 1Snrav .zm_-mm._”__m_e..m%pwzmmh:
OL ¥3Q7IN8 3HL 40 ALITAISNOLS3Y 3IHL 39 1IVHS 1l 'S¥NdJ0 "S1HOIT 13341S ANV ‘AL 3718VD YILYVNO LSYIHLNOS
ONIQV Y93 4l ‘Q3HSITEVLS3I 34V SNOILVAIT3 401 3ITTOHNVIW 3ONO 'I0IAY3S INOHJITIL 'STIVHILVI d3IM3S ‘30IAY3IS ¥ILVM ‘3OIAY3S 43INYOD LSIMHLNOS
SVO ‘378VI AYUVWIYC 'SHINYOASNVHL 214103713 'SYIWHOASNV YL
- . ¥ ANV € 2 ‘| SLOT dO0d4 3AI¥A LSYNH3NId 40 3AIS HLYON 3HL Q3LNNOW aVd 'S318VI JI1¥103713 AYVANOI3IS ANV AdVWIYL 1V
// LOLOT \ ONOTIV A3L3TdNOD SI MIVM3AIS SV 3JANIL HONS 1V V 1071LNO 9NOTV 404 J3LNVH9 SININISVI AVIHI3IAO ANV ANNOHOHIANN L3IMNVTIE
~< / \f d3L0NYLSNOD 38 T11IVHS M1IVM3EAIS 1071 HOVI NO NOILONYLSNOD
// \\ _ \ - 3SNOH 3HL HLIM NOILIOINNMNOD NI @3T1IVLSNI 38 T11IVHS M1VM3AIS 'SS3T 4O 3JYOW ‘S3HIV S9°tl SNIVLNOD NOISIAIQENS
™~ ~ , / ,,J.////
RN ) &2 ~ — . . z
~— = / \ & T~ | ATINO 3SN ATNIAVA 3JIONIS 404 A3LVN9IS3A SI 1071 HOVI 40343HL S1dVd TTVIIO3A ANV L1334 NI 34V NMOHS S3ONVLSId 11V 18
~ RN \ Y T [ 10141SIa TIVILN3IQAIS3Y ATNINVA 3719NIS ) I-d G3INOZ SI NoIsIAIgans _ @0
N G100 2 / 7 \ “ p { NId NOdI ¢.8/G ) SNHL NMOHS 13S SIN3ANNNOW NOJdI _ .%,vﬁ_@
// J\ \ €7 107 | | m3 'S3S0ddNd 1334¥1S HO04 ‘YMOI ‘39A14a713 | &
// , ' | ! mw 40 ALID 3HL Ol 431VIId3d 34V SAVM 40 1HOIY 13341S 11V . SNHL NMOHS ANNOd4 SLN3IWNNOW NOJdI ! m
N o / T~ _ mn
// \ \\ /// _ | |__|m.
> / ! ™~ _ _\_ 2 S31ON TTVHIN3D !
. ¢ o100 ~ / y s ~ __ _ NOOTLidaw L% od S.H 38 oM _
~ N W ~.re _
o g / “r AN T~ b L0
. 2N C ! _
/ \ \\ S ?@mﬁwwz/\kw . ‘o.m . . . _
/// \ \ AN oV —— —— — _ 829801 - "'M.GE-.IE-.68°'N \
S N ' Q0O° W 3 10°0¢I Q ,00°09 3 10°0¢€I 5 .00 . : - ! - .
Eumozo“ﬁv &uwﬁnam_w aNno4 | vt e AN \ \ N AN - oIIII IIIII Q - ———— H\LJ _I_Illtm_:lumﬂull |_.o|_ Mw.oo 68 0068 .00°G8 ] . .90°68 BE VI . .00°0S
€-6.-Gl NOILO3S A S N PP -5 ) RV L U - ~T % _LNawasv3 .0€ .08 | . . ? Q M
¥3L4VNO LSVIHLNOS o NG | | Inawasva ALrin M.n.__l. | AL e wamas — N T Rt NI H N S S I _ L
YANYOD LSVIHLNOS ~__ \ , o co e ~—— 8 FOVNIVNA ‘MIM3S *1 e, 8 o 8 | ® r L ek el -
~< / ’ N N % _ L= m—. g | S L e ON _ﬂ_ =% [ o anasy3 ALILA | | | inawasva atrun Fer]
! ~_ -~ / \ S 2 of . _ B o > cC > IE | NIVHa “¥3IM3s &1 | | & 3ouNivia ‘43am3s | @ ] /‘
~_ & /. 43 i 5t | =5 = f a e N
.o / S >3 _ e ||| : HE s
/ ~ / \ N o % ol | _\_ | ]| 0070l el g = o .00°0€| _ j I | o o
,/\ ~ / . // 25 ] o 1| _wﬁ " 3,62-.9G-.68 N " o i " "3,52-.95-.68'N _ J.N_ || _ i -
. / ) o C ] | 2> = _ cw = m 2 o SHK | _ _ s
-7 S Kae AR ~ g r= m m Oo - =
. A A ] L |z z z = NN DR - I |3 55 z - ol |2 - A ;
N ] . S N N of8 = 1 1g:e  sag1 gl o3 o[ ; : iy/o ; 4158 s :
;o UL O [ : 3 PO SE O Fs 9 oE éfs 8l ¢ ks cigl B B ool 22 €€ 32 PC 3 S€ #End 98 i Le & 182 :
\ ~ \||- g else e .o&_ 50 el = 3l o|% 0| 82 12| A e 2 a1 I e | | o? "ni oo Q! _mau %
— T— / / . N R n g | |4 ik 2R 1| | l2g EE RS 4 BE: EEEET 14 R 5
e \ I L q 2 |5 = = o) | oooer I |0 5 L1 1 ooos | |l = = E.M_ = | 2 o ]
> & \ I S = 5 1| | ! 3.62-.9G-.68'N ! = S ! "3.527,957.68'N ol | _ 3 Z < -
2 g \ / S_ | 2 . S I _ | 7/ _ | [l I 11 o (v Mw 2 -
- -~ / < l.l B3 b~ _ | g | \_ _ 'c _ _ | & n 4 m -
= ] . _ ‘7100 m_ &l Zo N—. 3|'n L _ llr" " "\M o |7 iR ! L N M
2 I __ T gER T g oy 8 ki e i e = d s
d i o > 2 . . \ = -
E - | _ Wols | | T | o,__ 1 o L S| | o | _ m S -
M > _ ! N QE+ __3NT _ MOVEL3S_ | || _on@gung _ _ _3aNa __ovel3s _| 6 _ONIATINg_ _ .9, o =2 L A _ a8 sovaiss _ _ __oNITINg _ _ ava ||| ovalss _ oNigTINg o/0F - m _ Rt
W M% | | 5 _.Mul_ _ ~ 7 - 1 T @n.o Gl Gl ._n\\e\ - I _ _ _ V»Onv . n./_u
LY | [ e IR PO R Hu [ ¥ R SR O N O Y M N T S VU D S (R B PR - ) -
o o .°m —_ & a - . & . . a |- . . o o . : 3] ' o . o 7] - . a a . . a —— o rra
S g:3° —_— NG ._..: _ L ? A.m_mm |— 0066 | \I .00°G8 _I | ,00°C8 0058 _ \.Iooo__ ._| ék ﬁo _l oom__/ ._. 0068 | N..ooﬂw | 00°G8 90°¢8 .woomﬂl_ &\o — A
E =g o - "3.627,95-.68'N - - o - "3.52-,957.68'N - ~ -
_.I_.__ 2 wm SAIMN IN3IW3IsSVv3I AlILn o /| AINIW3ISVI ALITILN 8 NIVAYILVM L /l AININ3ISVI ALITILN 8 NIVANY3LVM l\ o o /| AINIW3ISVI ALITILN 8 NIVANY3LVM |\ AINIW3SVI ALITILN 8 NIVAYILVM I\ o x w o
? ms Lesagos ,00°0S 3 3 2 2
% w .r,unu................../......n..... .;:le.wOlomm.m W m>_ma hmmszmz-a w m m>_mn hmm==mz-u Muv ﬁwo- Y
o — o’ ~ - e -
— LN3IN3SVv3 LINIW3SV3 ALITILN 8 ¥3IM3S IN3IW3SV3 ALITILN 8 Y3IM3S AININISVI ALITILN B8 H3IM3S LNIN3ISVI ALITILN 8 H3IM3S
S T e— ALMILN & H3IM3S \ \ "3.62-,9G-+68°N / \ \I R B '3,52-,9G-668'N R l/ 3
M TN T -.T V7] _w. 0088 .N |—m T |g <8 T .00G8 V. T 0058 _m_ T 00'S8 \ J 0068 ,00G6 V._m__ 4 9, |&  [©0SOl J 008 I 008 co'ce _mJ Z16| V _w_ P G
4 | Co——— v P T S T %@ E R i e R L -39
© I I Ry , % o
! | [T | [T 9 . ~ _ ~ _ ~ _ _ ~ _ ~ _ _ _
& S R J TOANA e | Wovelds “oNiaIng - - - - - 3NM - IEEITTES 11 | oNang R s El - NI - MovaL3s oNIaTINg ENNp] MOVEL3S 9NN 3
o - o 8 5113 Z S 3 5 813 o I T R g M 5 5 5 5 A n I © |
L LU ! - ! RO » °l- ma ||l -2 —< < —|< mnd |3 zi P > ool 1§ =[S =< =S =< = S
- S S 63 te I3[0l 5|S 8|S 55 5|3 AN | [e.3 R Bel 1 2 5|8 5|2 5|5 518 2 1.8 50O
NOILLIGOY HINZL o S0 ouls LI i iga  Ob g 6 3 8 3 L ¥ 9 3™ G 5 !gjgEsMEsge !l | vy g € 3 ¢ g l 3l o 1AL 28
My GNISNMOL L D 2 4ul” =z |4l |4 18 14 19 sz 7|3l g 1 3lp2zMeep 3 1 A 18 |8 | 14 vV 10711NnO B3 8. D
- — inawasva @ = | |< < = < $ = < g ! |aZlemd259 2 E: < < s I -
ALITILN 8 d3M3S _.-.n- mo| ] | NIW3ISVI ALIALN LNIWISVI ALIILN ) mo ll_l|® _IMIM = _HI.M _ 2 ’ ' ’ ' ~ _ m l._lﬂ.
| o e ———— . ‘9°'0'd - | ® JOVNIVYA '8IM3S 8 JOVNIVHA “HIMIS — - —~] - S |“\\ < T B e e i il bty M B T o _.d..\_ 3
- -/ _ %y |\ -V—_- g 4 6 | L - - __ < ’ = >
: : AR | T | Tk e ST : A
N 64,65€| ” ~} 00'88 2 2 glus 00°G8 i 2 2 000l 0% .00°09 0% ,00°02| 0068 ,00'G8 00'G8 50°G02 . | .000¢ .
i Mgz oGess | ] | x—w _m x—w N S - N WO - I - R ._.mw\m OZGIEl - "3.62-.9G-.68'N_13 \ _ __ ___ _ RES / ﬂ
[} - - ~ < [} I I ' W Il W
£-64-Gl NOILO3S ¥3LYVNO L1SVIHLNOS 3NIT HLYON o , —_—— N\ ———— — r————— " ——————— — 1 ke IN3W3SV3 ALILn _/_/_ 2 r..\om.__ ANIW3SVI ALIILA “..dn__ < / ? ! | N4 NoMI 8.8/8 ONNO4 |
- [ o [ el o e N A N AT TR~ N | ! o
([ LNIW3AVd NI . +. L1ND ANNOS ) _ | oh,wwdﬂwmn_ywm_\__»wm _...m_._ _ wh.zu”.m_vdwwwm__o »w_m_\_ﬁm o | _o__ S .n - _\\_ | N o ININISVI ALIILN 8 FOVNIVHA '83IM3S Qﬁ A\ | mu.mm@m:%_ .Fzmo,g_.._n”_w_ww_om
€-6/-Gl NOILJ3S G 00 | | _ _ | | o« ¥ i L0 | 57 8| ;o oy | | o N
¥3L4VNO LSVIHLNOS rm / Lo L L] 2 || Bt g m® | | “ov Lo | _ N ! | Y3ANYOD LSIMHLYON
H3INJO0O 1SVIHLYON _ _ | _ JM m\ lm| .”H. " _ | _ _.u.v._sum_ _ WWUMw . m“ _ _ | _ R . . . \ /@Ox | |
rm S~ o e __ _Joi 2= ’ 2" _ 3 = / \
m i _ /_/ __ __ 53 _ _ -u\l _mu | ms.ﬁ z5 o L.lo._...#.__ / ¢ Lo N
-- -- -- -- -- 1 -- -- -- TN IN3W3SV3 ALLN | 3> 3 3 S ri 5 N L Nawasva auin 9 "/ _ INSNISYT ALALN \ \ | !
_ ! | ! _/// | I £ o [ Ihﬂuﬂum‘ml_l>ﬂ_._ﬂal A II_\_\_ m 40 ﬁ”ﬂu B 3OUNIWHQ MaM3S — ) - € JOVNIVHA ‘¥IM3S / 1N3W3sV3 L _
o oo ! _ o oo o | 5 i~ | L+ & 3ouNivia wam3s ey - e wu_.ml_ d._._//\mw N \\ AN © E3M3s _r
s _ A N I b 84 100 I S SR s ol A o
i - -
AVId 90d ‘NL1V
052'82 Z Sl oz oozl ol
L082S VMOI 'LHOdN3AVA - GLgIl 6l 006/l 6
- 050'll 8l 006/l 8
. P gorge 92 GL9'ce 9l 006'll 9
97 SH3IdOT3IA3A WHVH4 ANISNMOL e oz obLEe 3 Py S
W'd WS 3HL 40 1SvV3 € IONVH ‘HLYON 6/ dIHSNMOL — ssrse [ ve sosce | v 052’9 v
Gl NOILD3S 40 d¥3aLYVNO LSVIHLNOS Mmowmm_ MM MNMM M MMM.__ M
dH1 4O d41VH HL1HON 3H1 40 1ld4Vvd SNI3g . . .
050l 12 ozg'el I 006'll _
1334 34vNOS ‘ON 1334 34VYNOS ‘'ON 1334 34VNOS ‘ON
4
VMOI 395dilddi13 40 AlID 3dH1 Ol Sov | Sstarevn | 0% | ever | .oosc.ee | 009 ; SV3YV 107
,00°Gl "M.SE-.£07 SN N AT 9682 +00-,00-,06 ,00°Gl o
,00'GI '3.62-.9G . v¥'N 2°1e 98¢ w00-,00-,06 ,00'Gl 14
NOILIQAV HLN3IA313 WHVI ANISNMOL ...
,00°Gl "3.62-.9G . ¥¥'N 1212 9G°82 +00-,00-,06 007Gl Z o .om o o
PIGI "MSE- LY PPN iy 0482 «00-.2£-.06 ,00°Gl _ o S—
ONRiv38 d38NNN 0 os
n— o .—.< l_ Q I—< z _ n— LNIONVL QuoHD QYOHD JHv vii3aa sniavy | "0 0o

VAN3IOV




VANIOV

68150 ATWA

=
e T, A4 pezausmaage ab mabg . - oot
KNG MAaHs STl ' s

1 BO0Y 10, SUTIIAG ¥ #ivp Tamms seeaq dn
8002 ‘62 JNYNHEES oM

- - 7 . — Topeefs e

NIV LUD WORNAN T SR

_ WMOL LHOdHIAY]
“0'd 'SHIINIONT DNILIASROD
HIAAIN - mu_mmzw>

>n nmzcmmxm

IVQ\NH% m-u_.d.e .

MRS du:ﬁ.siun ¥ Wy

: . QU0
.y e W o | 1em : ou0E
vitn_s:;:igﬁu&g*iygﬁﬁb R 0 .
pumizofied s Jaok Larme papefis A i peredadd . D00
e puraody uffessar $ani TR WL AR Ao 3 ) 2z
c

. - . N T B 9z9% .
s . B - e : - | o'E .
1334 2Al¥0E

% g
3 1
wlojoldu|ufelx]=ieja)m

CEBLHYND LSTAUNDS
Ezgoe EERMHANDE

P ol
OGN |

e e

BHIHvan o | o - B — | sasnn
THOHO [T OHVY viEg  [saigva

- NOLIeY- SIHL mc LSAW ALVHOT NISYE NOILNILIO
TYNOIZY 3HL HOd JNIAWASYT -SS30TY NV SY ONY LNAWASVE
ALFILNONY AOVNIVHG "MAMIS v 'S¢ 0ILvNeIsI0 51 W LUTLNe

“SINEWISYE . ALIILO GNY FOVNIVHG ‘Hamas
SY QIIYNGISZO0 JaV T OGNV M P H .u..m '3 ‘g's'e W siouno

S0782E}
“H.g0A 00N

] NOILOTS, HILHWIG LSIMHANGS ZWTT LSAFR ..

WOANY T %R

h , ‘43 gD '8 'Y S107LN0 NIHLM GINMVINGD SI
NOSLIGOY- S, 5

mu.m i md <mm4 ﬂmc.Nd-I _azOu.m x<m> Qem i

.w_,nm_

._.a.r_._..e .
Arasie

“M.0%", .mm..mm!

.W-Omu. mﬁl.mmﬁ .\sbhn.mn 468N - .&fﬂn _nm )

=
& e.mmn. m ’ ﬂdﬂ,h
&
i3
&
2

o
4
B
40 LNGH.A mz._‘ 0L -GIMOTTY 38 Ttk 30UVHISIA diind dWAS ON

NOILYAZTE -GNNo&S MaN JFHL OL ol FiOHNYIN 3L 1sneay

) HIATE FHL I0 ALINBISNOGSIH 3HL 38 1IVHS U 'SEND00
SNIGY BOIH h: ﬂme.u_ma.hmvm L mzor_h..?mn_m d0l 30HNYAN 35NO

Zoeel
‘5,00 L. 00N

L3 E N

TS ZONOON,

\\\\\ ¥

FEepit) )

N_goid -

£ 25685
————

goowavodd

PO._ HAVA. NG NOILOMHLSNGD
ASNOH 3HL HEW NGILONRPNOD NI 0aTIVISNI 38 TIVHS MIvMaadis

‘SLING0Md WNHIPULId GRDM HYTMS HIHLO ? ez T

ONY INVLNE 30 STOVHS WHIADS 'INVAOHJ QINGIT SLEOCSNYHL ‘3,60 45-68'5 l
33NPT HOM*BE "3HL 40 HLHON 134 ¢2 A1ILYWIXOHddy: QILVODT B 2

U154 0F2% » 3WNS$IS SKILVAIL0 GIMOTIV WOWIXVA | IN3dl )

HOMI OF ¥ NOLLIOOY SIHL 40 AN HANOS 3L 20 HINOS 1334

Q0b ATILYWIXCHJDY L5AM-L5YA SNNY { 1ISd 050" = JuNS53ud

SNt vH3d0 DN?OJ..E. WOWIXYW ) ANC3did S¥0 TVHNLYN HONE 9% ©

AKINISTI ALIEEA

W VNIV WINR
235044 ATILS B0
LB DL 04, QXL HORG ~—

L

107 FAILOFASIH 311 NO .
Xof ML K z.sOIw zo_._.<>m_|mm FHL HYH] HILVEED HO OL T¥nb3 i~
NUILYAZT1A NY LY GILSNHLSNOD 38 LSNA I HENMOYHL | 51C7 KO Tt

mNUZmn_mmm o4 | LNIN3SVE 3HL qu:JuE 1 HoE4 1S3IMOT FHL

'M.DO‘.E'.O
[ oMIBYIR Jannsdy |

LMZNIEYE ALTUR

6 30eavi B

Ed o
2cnzsya
4 H 4

T

ALRLR-B yIMES

idauls.
WS HLNOS -

R

- ‘V3uy Lo
CIVLO4. QNY. SHOVELZS ONINCZ SHNIWEILI0 J0 S3IS0dund- 3HL dOl

107 OFYISANN ONINORGY HHL HEIM TEARTIN 38 TTIVHS LOTILAC 3HL

| ATSALLOSAS3Y T GNY M ' 'H 'D T4 '3 ‘0 "D B 'V SL071LI0 ) 030NN
- S10LLND SMNOPGY 3HL LOOHLIM (NOS 38 LONNYS i HOAOWKL | 5101

-
| NGRS WS4 . AW G0 -
350 ATHWYA FTANIS HOJ QALYNOISZG SI 107 HOV3 S oSl ousas
YENHOD LSAMHIHON

13341S
PI€ HINOS

o

SIS0OAHNG LIZULES HOd “VMOL “3001H0T13
3 .c._o 3HL Ol GALYIASE IV SAVM 40 LHOlH LIFYLS TWV

SNDILYDIJIDSdS QHYONVLS 39ai¥GT3 30 ALD L1S3LvA
FHL HLIM . IONVAHOSOY NI G3TTVLSN 38 01 SINIFNIAOULM TIV

"1,00-L1-00°N HV3R 0L UFANSSY SYA E 6L~ NOLLDIS JO HLINS NVIHE NLLY

HALUYNG LSIMEINGS SHL 40 3N LSIM JHE AJAHNS SIHL BOJ NOLLIGAY HLJid WHY ONISKMOL : DIt H0H MNLLY
SIWM LHO 433ULE HOS ONY g LOILNO ONV €1 LO7Y 40 LVidIH ¥ DN lHvd NI . 10825 WMGE ‘LHOANIAYA
Q34907 Si: WALORELS FAL BEIHM L0071 FHL MHIM SIUNLONYLS ’ W Yie, OHL 40 LSv3 € SDNVH HLHON 8L JHENMOL .

'syo .muh_uha_ﬂmﬂwmpmwwuﬁuﬂwﬂpwbmmhw&wmquamu%m:%mwwm: w_m_wuw“__w ¥i NODILDIAS S0 HILHVAD ...mme.:._.:om gL 40 SIVH 183M JHL 40 1HYd DNIi3E . 1HNGD 133BLE WEE LSVA bize

s5T71 Mo Fow “STHIY GET SNIVANOD NOISHAIGENS (gou .NGQ_IQ.._N 40 ALID 3HL OL - 077 'SHIGOTIATIU WHV S ANISNMOL

403M3HL SLUVS TYWIDI0 GNY LE3d NI 3HY MMOHS SIONVLSIO TW . - . ‘ © URdGTEAAD - BINMO

{ M NOYi .88, | |.o|| o se z;mmm. I35 SLNZWANOW mOMIT - z O — ..—l—DQ< I 1—.. Zm> m w E Mu— < “— QZN w z; O |_| ‘ . ,; o5 = 00 a0 )

{ Nid NOH 987G ) = SQIRL NMOHS GNND SLNZRNNOW KOM| & e Mo,

S | | 40 LVd WNId S T

BTEI—6SE(£9S) L08ZC UMOI "INOANIAYG Iaauis Hi09 Eovd TTTV  Sakam -1 GTATa




RESOLUTION 04-31

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE STORM WATER DETENTION POND IN
TOWNSEND FARMS AS A PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT, ORDERING THAT THE
STANDARD CONSTRUCTION SPECIFICATIONS BE AMENDED TO INCLUDE
DESIGN CHARACTERISTICS FOR STORM WATER DETENTION PONDS AND
ORDERING THE CREATION OF A STORM WATER UTILITY

WHEREAS, Townsend Farm Developers, L.C. has requested that the City of Eldridge
consider accepting ownership of a storm water detention pond to serve the Townsend
Farm subdivisions, and

WHEREAS, The City of Eldridge and Townsend Farm Developers, L.C., entered into a
development agreement committing the city to study the concept of a municipally owned
detention pond, and

WHEREAS, the City of Eldridge has received recommended components of a storm
water detention pond from Shive Hattery, Inc.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ELDRIDGE, IOWA.

1. That the storm water detention pond in the Townsend Farm Additions be accepted as
a public improvement provided that the design adheres to the design components set
forth in the attached memo from Shive Hattery, Inc.

2. That the Standard Construction Specifications found in Chapter 10, Title C of the
Eldridge City Code be amended to include storm water detention ponds as set forth in
the attached memo from Shive Hattery, Inc.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a storm water utility be created to collect fees to
finance the costs of maintenance and improvements for the storm water detention pond.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS 11" DAY OF OCTOBER, 2004.

N 247} %M

Mayor

Cl>/0/t,u e @Wu

clerk

AGENDA




AGENDA

Document Prepared By: Jack D. Darland, 715 Union Arcade Building, Davenport, IA 52801 563-322-2681

RESTRICTIVE AND PROTECTIVE COVENANTS

The undersigned, TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C. and MICHAEL D. SANTEE

and ANN M. SANTEE, husband and wife, as owner and proprietor of all of the real estate comprising

TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION to the City of Eldridge, Iowa, does hereby establish the

following Restrictive and Protective Covenants which shall be Covenants running with the land, to-wit:

1. All Lots described herein shall be known, described, and used solely as residential
Lots, and no residence shall be erected on any residential building Lots other than one detached single
family dwelling not to exceed two and one-half stories in height, and a private garage for not less than two
automobiles.

2. No residence shall be erected on any residential building Lot nearer than thirty (30) feet to
the front Lot line, nor nearer than thirty (30) feet to any rear Lot line. The rear line restriction shall not
apply to a garage located on the rear one-quarter of a Lot.

3. No trailer, basement, tent, shack, garage, barn, or other outbuilding erected in the
tract shall at any time be used as a residence, temporarily or permanently, nor shall any residence of a

temporary character be permitted.

RESTRICTIVE AND PROTECTIVE COVENANTS
TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION
Page 1 of 6



AGENDA

4, No building shall be erected on any Lot unless the design and location is in
harmony with existing structures and locations in the tract and does not violate any Protective Covenants.
In any case, no single family dwelling shall be permitted on any Lot in this addition having a ground floor
square foot area of less than 1200 square feet in the case of a one-story structure, or less than 1200 square
feet above grade in the case of a split level, nor less than a total of 1650 square feet in the case of a one
and one-half or two-story structure.

5. Titleholder of each Lot, vacant or improved, shall keep his Lot or Lots free of weeds and
debris.

6. No obnoxious or offensive trade shall be carried on upon any Lot, nor shall
anything be done thereon which may be or become an annoyance or nuisance to the neighborhood.

7. A perpetual easement is reserved over the rear of each Lot as shown on said Plat
for utility installation and maintenance, and drainage, where applicable.

8. No parking of trailers, boats, campers, or commercial vehicles shall be allowed
outside residences in the subdivision, except for commercial vehicles in the area on normal business
deliveries, or commercial vehicles involved in the construction of a house during regular working hours.

9. No antenna shall extend over 4 feet beyond the roof line. No free standing
antenna or satellite reception dishes shall be allowed in said addition.

10.  There has been formed an Iowa non-profit corporation known as, “Townsend Farm
Regional Detention Facility Maintenance Association, Inc.” (hereinafter referred to as The Association),
whose purposes, among other things, shall be to acquire title the real estate upon which the Townsend
Farm Regional Detention Facility is to be constructed, and thereafter to provide maintenance of said

Detention Facility, all as provided hereinafter. The Townsend Farm Regional Detention Facility is being

RESTRICTIVE AND PROTECTIVE COVENANTS
TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION
Page 2 of 6



AGENDA

designed and constructed to provide regional detention capability for not just this subdivision, but other
undeveloped real estate generally bounded by the Cobbler’s Knotch subdivisions to the North, Buttermilk
Road to the West, the Wiggers property to the South, and the Townsend Farm First, Third, Fourth, Fifth
and Sixth Additions to the East. It is the intention that as said areas are developed, all lot owners in

TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION to the City of Eldridge, lowa shall become members of

the Association, and subject to the rights and responsibilities as set out hereinafter. The Association,
through 1t’s Board of Directors, shall establish, levy and collect from all lot owners in this addition, an
annual assessment reasonably calculated to pay for the pro rata maintenance and upkeep of the Townsend
Farm Regional Detention Facility and OUTLOT M. Payment of the assessment shall be the personal
continuing obligation of the lot owner, and shall survive his or her transfer of title, and shall be a lien upon
the lot when placed of record and paid in full. These obligations shall continue until such time as The
Association receives written notice from the City of Eldridge, Iowa that it intends to undertake the
maintenance and upkeep of the Townsend Farm Regional Detention Facility. Upon receipt of said notice
from the City of Eldridge, Iowa, The Association shall dedicate to the public the real estate parcel upon
which is constructed the Townsend Farm Regional Detention Facility and outlot M of this addition.

11 These Covenants are to run with the land and shall be binding on all parties
claiming under them until twenty (20) years, at which time said Covenants shall be automatically
extended for successive periods of ten years, unless by vote of the majority of the then owners of the Lots
it is agreed to change said Covenants in whole or in part.

12 If the parties hereto, or any of them, or their heirs or assigns shall violate or
attempt to violate any of the Covenants or Restrictions herein within twenty (20) years from the date

hereof, it shall be lawful for any person or persons owning any other Lots in said addition to prosecute and

RESTRICTIVE AND PROTECTIVE COVENANTS
TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION
Page 3 of 6



AGENDA

bring proceedings at law or in equity against the person or persons violating or attempting to violate any
such Covenant or Restriction, to prevent him or them from so doing or to recover damages or other dues
for such violation.

13 Installation of all city sidewalks, should they be required shall be paid for by the
then owners of said Lot or Lots at the time building permits are taken out with the City of Eldridge.

14 Invalidation of any of these Covenants by judgment or court order shall in no way
affect any of the other provisions which shall remain in full force and effect.

15 The right to enforce these Covenants by injunction, together with the right to cause the
removal, by due process of law, any structure or part thereof erected or maintained in violation hereof, is
reserved to the several owners of the several Lots in this subdivision and to their heirs and assigns and to
the City of Eldridge is specifically noted as a provision of a covenant,

16 TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C., as subdivider of this addition, in order that

there be harmony in design of the exterior of any residential building, or buildings, incidental to such
residential use as may be erected in said addition, the exterior design of any such building, or buildings,

incidental to such residential use shall be approved by MEL FOSTER CO. PROPERTIES, INC. OF

IOWA, and unless such exterior design be so approved such residential building or buildings, incidental
thereto, shall not be erected. Sloping or pitched roofs are desired. and flat roofs, except for occasional
decks, are to be avoided. Flat-roof, low modern houses, butterfly or excessive shed roofs, exotic designs
of any nature, extremes in architecture and experiments in design are not deemed to be in keeping with the

residential community, and consequently might not be approved. This approval must be in writing.

RESTRICTIVE AND PROTECTIVE COVENANTS
TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION
Page 4 of 6



AGENDA

17. MEL FOSTER CO. PROPERTIES, INC. OF IOWA shall also have absolute and final

approval on the erection and construction of any outbuildings, sheds, or appurtenant structures as far as
the location, style, design, or size. This approval must be in writing.

18.  All OUTLOT, excluding OUTLOT M, as shown by Plat hereof, shall be conveyed,
together with the contiguous building Lot located adjacent thereto. All OUTLOTS referred to
hereinabove are designated for use as sewer drainage and utility easements. The title holder of each such
OUTLOT shall keep his or her OUTLOT or OUTLOTS free from weeds and debris, and shall maintain
same in a reasonable manner. Further, no title holder of any such OUTLOT may excavate or in any way
alter or change the terrain or topography of such OUTLOT without the prior written consent and approval
of MEL FOSTER CO. PROPERTIES, INC. OF IOWA and THE CITY OF ELDRIDGE, IOWA.
Said OUTLOTS shall be included with the adjoining numbered lot for the purposes of determining zZoning
setbacks and total Lot area. All OUTLOTS referred to hereinabove are designated for use as sewer
drainage and utility easements, and OUTLOT M is also further designated as an access easement for the
regional detention basin located West of this addition.

OUTLOT M is designated as an access easement for the regional detention facility to be
located West of this addition. Title to said OUTLOT M shall be retained by the developer, and OUTLOT
M shall be maintained by the developer. Title to OUTLOT M may be transferred to the City of Eldridge
upon written request for same from the City of Eldridge, Iowa. In the absence of such written request and
at the discretion of the developer, title to said OUTLOT M may be retained by the developer or transferred
to the lowa non-profit corporation known as Townsend Farm Regional Detention Facility, Inc., or to the

then owner of Lot 1 of Townsend Farm Seventh Addition to the City of Eldridge, lowa. In the event said

RESTRICTIVE AND PROTECTIVE COVENANTS
TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION
Page 5 of 6



AGENDA

OUTLOT M is transferred to the then owner of said numbered lot, the lot will be subject to the duties and
responsibilities as set forth hereinabove,

DATED this _15thday of May , 2006.

TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C.

BY: MEL FOSTER CQ.PROPERTIES, INC. OF IOWA

ROBERT C. FICK, President

STATE OF IOWA, SCOTT COUNTY, ss:

On this_15th day of May . 2006, before me, the undersigned, a Notary Public in and
for said State, personally appeared ROBERT C. FICK, to me personally known, who being by me duly
sworn, did say that he is the PRESIDENT OF MEL FOSTER CO. PROPERTIES, INC. OF IOWA,
the Managing Member of TOWNSEND FARM DEVELOPERS, L.C., and that said instrument was
signed on behalf of said corporation by authority of the Board of Directors; and that the Board of
Directors acknowledges the execution of said instrument to be the voluntary act and deed of said
corporation by it voluntarily executed.

LORI LEVETZOW t% C%W
Commission Number 143962 OV"

W&?ﬁﬂé‘s%w RES NOTARY PUBLIC in and for the State of lowa

-
[
>

RESTRICTIVE AND PROTECTIVE COVENANTS
TOWNSEND FARM SEVENTH ADDITION
Page 6 of 6



AGENDA
CHAPTER 10: POST-CONSTRUCTION STORM WATER MANAGEMENT REGULATIONS

Section
1.00 Purpose
2.00 Applicability
3.00 Storm water detention criteria
4.00 Exemptions
5.00 Storm water detention plan review
6.00 Storm water detention plan requirements
7.00 Common detention facilities
8.00 Completion of facilities
9.00 Responsibilities
10.00 Appeal
§ 1.00 PURPOSE.

The purpose of these regulations is to diminish threats to public health, safety and welfare caused by runoff of excessive
storm water from new development and redevelopment. This excessive storm water could result in the flooding of
damageable properties. The cause of increase in storm water runoff quantity is the development and improvement of land
and as such this chapter regulates these activities to reduce adverse impacts.

§ 2.00 APPLICABILITY.

No building permit shall be issued for the construction, reconstruction or structural alteration of a building, and/or its
parking area nor shall a certificate of occupancy be granted for a use nor shall a preliminary plat, final plat or site plan be
approved without conformity with the provisions of the storm water detention regulations.

§ 3.00 STORM WATER DETENTION CRITERIA.

(A) All storm water storage areas must be designed to contain and safely pass storm water runoff. When platting, the
land extending to the centerline of any adjacent right-of-way shall be considered part of the development for purposes of
determining the runoff rate. Adequate spillway provisions shall be provided to transport peak runoff from a 100-year storm
assuming the outlet to be plugged. All storm water facilities shall be designed in accordance with the design standards
established by the city.

(B) All areas within the city shall comply with these regulations.

(1) The required volume of storm water detention shall be that necessary to handle the runoff of a 100-year rainfall, for
the critical duration from the drainage area tributary to the storm water storage area based on full development of said
tributary area, less the volume discharged during the same duration at the approved release rate. In addition, the detention
basin shall be designed to restrict the peak rate of discharge from the drainage area during a two-year, 24-hour rainfall
event to be at or below the predevelopment levels.

(2) For sites less than 20 acres, the required detention storage (RDS) will be that found to be the most critical resulting
from the inflow from the run-off of a fully developed tributary area from a 100-year storm and the outflow of the five-year
storm on a predevelopment basis with the same area. This can be expressed by the following equation:

Duration
of the
critical

Release rate from 5- X 100-

year storm year

Inflow rate from
RDS = critical 100-year storm -
(cfs)

storm
(sec)

(3) For sites greater than 20 acres, the method of sizing of the detention storage volume must be approved by the City
Engineer.

(C) Detention storage may be provided as a dry bottom or wet bottom storage area.

(1) Dry bottom storm water storage areas may be designed to serve a secondary purpose for recreation, open space
parking or other types of uses that will not be adversely affected by intermittent flooding.



AGENDA

(a) A method of carrying the low flow through these areas shall be provided in addition to a system of drains to
prevent soggy areas.

(b) Outlet control structures shall be designed as simply as possible and shall require little or no attention for proper
operation. Each storm water storage area shall be provided with a method of emergency overflow in the event that a storm
in excess of the 100-year frequency storm occurs. This emergency overflow facility shall be designed to function without
attention and shall become part of the excess storm water passageway. Hydraulic calculations shall be submitted to the City
Engineer to substantiate all design features.

(c) Both outlet control structures and emergency overflow facilities shall be designed and constructed to fully protect
the public health, safety and welfare. Storm water runoff velocities shall be kept at a minimum and turbulent conditions at an
outlet control structure will not be permitted without complete protection for the public safety. The use of fences shall be kept
to a minimum and used only as a last resort when no other method of protection is feasible.

(d) Paved surfaces that are to serve as storm water storage shall be designed with permanent-type control outlets.
Emergency overflow areas shall be provided. The maximum storm water ponding depth in any paved area shall not exceed
six inches.

(2) (a) Wet bottom storm water storage areas shall be designed with all of the items required for dry bottom storm
water storage areas, except that the provisions of division (C)(1)(a) above shall not be required.

(b) However, the following additional conditions shall be complied with:
1. Water surface areas shall not exceed one-fifteenth of the tributary drainage area.

2. Facilities shall be provided to lower the pond elevation by gravity flow for cleaning purposes and shoreline
maintenance. Shoreline protection shall be provided to prevent erosion from wave action.

3. Minimum normal water depth shall be four feet. If fish are to be maintained, some portion of the pond area should
be a minimum of nine feet deep.

4. Control structures for storm water release shall be designed to operate with only a minor increase in the water
surface level when the design storage capacity has been exceeded. Hydraulic calculations shall be submitted to the City
Engineer to substantiate all design features.

(D) The city may, in lieu of the detention requirements detailed in the ordinance, accept infiltration practices designed in
accordance with the lowa Storm Water Management Manual. Engineering calculation demonstrating infiltration rates shall
be included with the application.

§ 4.00 EXEMPTIONS.

The following shall be exempt from these regulations:

(A) Any final plat approved by January 1, 2003, and based upon a preliminary plat that was approved prior to January 1,
2000, subject to the development not being required to provide detention facilities by any other ordinances of the city;

(B) A preliminary or final plat of single-family development consisting of lots, all of which are one acre or larger; and
(C) Any single-family and two-family developed and undeveloped lots which existed on January 1, 2000.

§ 5.00 STORM WATER DETENTION PLAN REVIEW.

Storm water detention plans shall be submitted to the City Engineer for review.

(A) For new or expanding commercial, industrial and multi-family developments, a storm water detention plan shall be
submitted as part of the site plan review.

(B) For new single-family and two-family residential developments, a storm water detention plan shall be submitted as
part of the plat review.

(C) If no plat or site plan review is required, a storm water detention plan must be approved by the City Engineer before a
building permit is issued.

§ 6.00 STORM WATER DETENTION PLAN REQUIREMENTS.

(A) Each applicant shall submit all calculations and other such information as deemed necessary to demonstrate to the
City Engineer the storm water runoff rate and capacity of storm water storage facilities.

(B) Required information may vary according to the size of development, but shall include, but not be limited to, the
following:

(1) Map of the property and immediate vicinity showing elevation of contours (based on city datum);
(2) Mapping and description of existing and proposed drainage system features of the property and immediate vicinity;

(3) Physical features of the property and immediate vicinity, including, but not limited to, the state and type of
development in the area, public infrastructure and other similar characteristics; and



AGENDA

(4) If the development is to be staged, a plan of how the storm water detention requirement will be met for each stage.

§ 7.00 COMMON DETENTION FACILITIES.

(A) The city may, in lieu of on-site detention facilities, accept the furnishing of off-site facilities which, when added to on-
site detention facilities, shall provide sufficient storage capacity to provide the storm water detention required to meet this
regulation. Until such time as the permanent off-site storm water detention facilities are available, temporary on-site
detention shall be provided.

(B) An acceptable legal contract between the developer and the off-site land owner shall be approved by the City
Council.

§ 8.00 COMPLETION OF FACILITIES.

The storm water detention facilities shall be constructed and in use according to the following criteria.

(A) For commercial, industrial and multi-family developments, the facilities shall be constructed concurrent with site
grading. A certificate of completion shall be furnished by the developer’s engineer certifying that they have been constructed
according to the approved plans before a certificate of occupancy is issued by the city.

(B) For single-family and two-family residential building, the developer’s engineer shall certify that the structural
improvements have been substantially complete and the detention facility rough graded before a building permit is issued. A
certificate of completion shall be furnished by the engineer certifying that the facilities into which the lot(s) drain have been
constructed according to the approved plans before a certificate of occupancy permit is issued by the city.

§ 9.00 RESPONSIBILITIES.

(A) The developer shall be responsible for providing a plan of ownership of the detention facilities involving a single
owner, an association or another plan of ownership approved by the city.

(B) The owner shall be responsible to ensure the continuing functioning of the facility as originally designed and intended.
All plans submitted for storm water detention systems shall describe an adequate procedure for normal maintenance for the
detention system. Any failure of the storm water detention system due to inadequate normal or capital maintenance shall be
the responsibility of the owner of the property on which the detention system is located. It shall also be the property owner’s
responsibility to remedy any negligence in maintenance that resulted in the failure of the system. The submittal of plans for
such a system or the purchase of property on which such system is located shall be deemed as acceptance of responsibility
for normal and capital maintenance of the system.

(C) The developer shall dedicate an easement to the city reserving the land for use as a storm water detention facility
providing the city with the right to inspect the facility, and the necessary easements for ingress and egress.

(D) (1) The detention basin owner shall be responsible for the following items.

(a) An annual report on the detention basin condition, using a checklist developed by the city, shall be submitted to
the Director of Public Works.

(b) At five year intervals, the basin shall be inspected by a professional engineer registered in the state, using a
checklist developed by the city. A report of this inspection shall be submitted to the Director of Public Works within 60 days
of the inspection. An annual report is not required the year when the five-year report is due.

(c) Detention basin owners shall notify subsequent owners of his, her or their maintenance responsibilities and
transfer basin maintenance records to the party with active maintenance responsibility.

(2) Atany time, the Director of Public Works, or his or her designee, may provide inspection of the detention facilities
as deemed appropriate. If the Director finds any maintenance work is necessary, the Director shall serve a written order to
the owner of the facilities, specifying therein the work necessary to be done and providing for a reasonable time for its
completion. Any property owner to whom an order is directed shall have the right, within three days from service of the order,
to appeal to the City Administrator who shall review the order within five working days and file his or her decision. If the City
Administrator fails to respond within five working days, it shall be assumed that the appeal is denied. Unless the order is
revoked or modified, it shall remain in full force and be obeyed by the owner as directed within the time established by the
Director’s written order or at the time as modified by the City Administrator’s decision. When an owner to whom an order has
been issued fails to comply within the time specified, the Director shall remedy the condition, or contract with others for such
purpose, and charge all costs, including administration, to whom the order is directed. If the cost of remedying a condition is
not paid within 30 days after the mailing of a statement from the Director of Public Works, the cost shall be assessed against
the property for collection in the same manner as a property tax. In the event the association fails or is unable to pay the
costs associated with detention facility maintenance, these costs shall be assessed against those users of the facility based
upon their percentage of use.

§ 10.00 APPEAL.

(A) The City Council may, in the resolution approving the preliminary plat of any subdivision and upon appeal of the
developer, or the recommendation of the City Engineer, waive or change the requirements of this chapter for a particular
development whenever the developer demonstrates either:



AGENDA

(1) That, due to the location of the property, strict compliance would provide no discernible benefit for reduction of
flooding on any plat adjacent or downstream property;

(2) That, due to the nature of the property, strict compliance would create unusual hardship out of proportion to any
foreseeable benefit and that the requested change or reduction in requirements will not increase the risk of flooding of any
building or the buildable portion of any lot on any adjacent or downstream property; or

(3) That the developer, in lieu of a detention facility, provide storm water management sufficient to achieve the purpose
of this chapter by keeping storm water runoff from the property in accordance with § 3.00 of this chapter.

(B) Developers of new or expanding commercial, industrial and multi-family developments shall make appeals as per the
provisions of the site plan review regulations in city code.



AGENDA

The regular meeting of the Board of Trustees of the Eldridge Electric and Water Utility Board was called
to order at 5:00 P.M. on October 22nd, 2024, at Eldridge City Hall.

Board members present were Michael Bristley, Abby Petersen, Rachel Padavich, and Jeff Hamilton. Also

present, Lenny Larson, Collin Wilson, Marty O’Boyle, Ryan lossi, Nevada Lemke and Sadie Wagner.

Public Comment — Marty O’Boyle expressed his concerns about removing fluoride from the City’s water

supply and notifying the community.

Motion by Hamilton to approve amended Agenda to move item 6 and item 7-B to after item 9-C. Second

by Padavich. All Ayes. Motion Carries.

Motion by Padavich to approve Utility Board Minutes from October 8, 2024. Second by Petersen. All

Ayes. Motion Carries.
Administrative-

A. Update from Lenny Larson — ISG Engineering Project Leader. Lenny stated that they had a site
visit in September to go over the overall system. They have been sampling the media within the
filter to understand what media and stratification are there. He stated that the water tank under
the water plant is much larger than what was anticipated, and the city has plenty of storage. He
also stated they have a meeting scheduled next Tuesday for someone to come inspect the
aerator, once that is completed, they will know what shape it is in. Lenny stated they are going
through all documents and data that the city has shared with them and that they plan to sit
down with the city staff in November to go over their findings. He also mentioned that Cegan is
working with ACCO to vent the caustic out of the building to avoid earlier deterioration. He is
also working with J R Supply regarding the chlorine injection system to find out why the plant
was set up the way that it is to see if they can make changes to where the chlorine gas is mixed
with the water. Lastly, Lenny stated that if the city decided to remove fluoride, ISG could do
sampling throughout the city at certain hydrants to determine how quickly it is leaving the
system to enable them to better detect water age and how it is moving through the distribution

system. This would help calibrate their water model.

Financial —
A. Motion by Petersen to Approve Bills Payable in the amount of $80,014.68. Second by Padavich.

All Ayes. Motion Carries.



Electric

A.

AGENDA

Motion by Petersen to approve consolidating the Utility’s bank accounts with the City’s bank
accounts as recommended in the annual financial audit findings. Second by Padavich. All Ayes.
Motion Carries.

Motion by Padavich to approve a proposal from PFM to perform a Revenue Requirements
Analysis for the Water Department in the amount of $7,000 with an additional option of a Cost-
of-Service Study for an additional $13,000. Second by Hamilton. All Ayes. Motion Carries.
Discussion on implementing a Utility Billing Policy to establish delinquent billing and aged
debt/collections procedures. Possible utility policies were discussed amongst the board and city

staff.
Department-

Outages — none.

PCA Update — Given by Nevada Lemke. She shared with the board a graph of the PCA going back
to quarter 2 of 2022 and an explanation of the PCA and why it is charged or credited to the city
residents.

Motion by Padavich to approve wage increase for Dalton Eagle from $32.99/hr to $35.63/hr as a
result of completing Module A of the IAMU apprenticeship program and pursuant to the terms
of the CBA. Second by Petersen. All Ayes. Motion Carries.

Department Update — Given by Line Foreman Collin Wilson. Wilson stated they are continuing
their routine maintenance and wrapping up their underground projects before the weather
becomes cold and will start their overhead work in the winter. He also stated they are caught up

with new services being installed for new builds.

Water Department-

A.

Motion by Hamilton to approve replacing high service pump #2 in the amount of $5,083.00 plus
power connect fees from LMI. Second by Petersen. All Ayes. Motion Carries.

Motion by Hamilton to approve a quote from Cahoy for the repair of high service pump #2 at a
cost of $6,234. Second by Padavich. All Ayes. Motion Carries.

Department Update- Given by Water Operator Cegan Long. Long stated that ACCO would have
an analysis from the filter media samples back within a couple of days. On October 16™ the
water operators dealt with a potential water main break at Hardee’s. They found that Hardee’s
irrigation system broke and it was not the city’s portion. He also stated that tomorrow was their
last day of flushing with the expectation they may need to flush an extra couple of days but still

plan to be finished by the end of October. Cegan also made a statement about a part-time



AGENDA

employee, Gary Moore, who has recently moved that he would like to see return. He expressed
how much they appreciated him as an employee. Lastly, he stated they had a meeting with Van
Wert regarding upgrading the city water meters going forward to make meter reading easier on

both the Utility Billing Clerk and the Water Operators conducting the reads.

Motion by Padavich to adjourn the meeting at 6:16 P.M., to go into closed session pursuant to lowa
Code 21.5(1)a “To review or discuss records which are required or authorized by state or federal law to
be kept confidential or to be kept confidential as a condition for that governmental body’s possession or
continued receipt of federal funds.” Second by Petersen. A roll call vote was taken. Bristley Aye.

Petersen Aye. Padavich Aye. Hamilton Aye.

The regular meeting of the Board of Trustees of the Eldridge Electric and Water Utility Board resumed

open session at 6:42 P.M.
Financial-

C. Motion by Padavich to approve payment in the amount of $ 7,455 to Dickinson, Bradshaw, Legal

firm for legal services. Second by Petersen. All Ayes. Motion Carries.
Motion by Padavich to adjourn the meeting at 6:43 P.M. Second by Hamilton. All Ayes. Motion Carries.

Sadie Wagner
Billing Clerk



AGENDA

CITY OF

Va1 Eldridge

Eldridge Planning and Zoning Commission
October 17, 2024, 6:00 p.m., Eldridge City Hall

Minutes

The Eldridge Plan and Zone Commission met in open session in Eldridge City Hall at
6:00 p.m. on October 19, 2024. The meeting was called to order at 6:15 p.m. by
Chairman Karl Donaubauer. Present were Karl Donaubauer, Jennifer Vittorio, Dean
Ferguson, Mike Martin and Scott LaPlante. Brad Merrick was absent. Also present were
Jeff Martens and Brian Dockery.

The minutes from the September 19, 2024, meeting was presented for approval.
Motion by Vittorio to approve the minutes as amended. Seconded by Ferguson.
Motion carried 5-0 by voice vote.

Donabauer asked Martens to present the application and final plat for a replat of
Outlot A in Stone Brook 3™ Addition. Martens presented the request and confirmed
that the request was substantially in accordance with City Code. He also confirmed
that the engineering firm submitting the request for SKD, LC, owned by Paul Boffeli,
had stated that the reason for the subdivide was to separate the creek from the outlot
so the area with the detention pond could be turned over to a homeowners
association. Martin made a motion to approve the final plat. Ferguson seconded the
motion. The motion carried 5-0 by voice vote.

Martens presented a revised draft solar ordinance for review by the Commission.
Dockery made the Commission aware that by making Solar Farms a permitted use in I-
1 districts they would also be permitted uses per City Code in I-2 districts. Since the
Commissions intentions at the last meeting was to allow Solar Farms only in the SA
and -1 districts this presented a dilemma that was then discussed. Some possible
solutions discussed were setting a limit on the number of acres a Solar Farm could be
or adding Solar Farms to the I-2 list of prohibited uses. Martens offered to further
review these options and get advice from legal counsel on this issue. No action was
taken. LaPlante made a motion to table this ordinance. Vittorio seconded. Motion
carried 5-0 by voice vote. Martens will present a revised draft of the ordinance at the
next meeting.

Martin made a motion to adjourn the meeting at 7:00 p.m. Seconded by Ferguson.
Motion carried 5-0 by voice vote.



	~0 City Council Agenda 2024-11-4
	~1 City Council Minutes 10.21.24
	~2 Bills Payable November 4, 2024
	~3 Ordinance 2024-13 Updating Sewer Billing
	~4 Ordinance 2024-14 Updating Building Codes
	AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER EIGHT, TITLE C OF THE ELDRIDGE CITY CODE BY ADOPTING NEW BUILDING CODES, REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT WITH THIS ORDINANCE AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

	~5 Townsend Detention Memo Packet
	Townsend Farn Eleventh Addition Final Plat.pdf
	15208.dwg
	Model



	~6 Utility Board Minutes 10.22.24
	~7 Planning and Zoning Minutes 10.17.24
	Minutes


	AGENDA: 


